
          TUESDAY, 01/10/24 

 

R1 CHANTILLY [R-H] 

 

C1 - PRIX DE LA CHAMBRE DU DUC - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL WEATHER - 

Class 2 Divided Handicap - Flat - EUR € 53,000  

 
1. BEAUTIFUL ASPEN - Unplaced last time, won before that over 1900m in a Class 2 handicap 
on the PSF at Deauville on July 28th. Hard to rule out 

2. LOVE IS GOLD - Fair 3rd over 1950m at Chateubriant on August 16th in a Class 2 race on the 
latest outing. Capable of making an impact 

3. WILD PANSY - Credible 4th over 2000m at Parislongchamp in a Class 2 handicap on 
September 15th. Has work to do 

4. LORCAN - Two unplaced runs of late, 2nd before that over 2000m at Parislongchamp in a 
Class 2 handicap on June 9th. Among the leading chances 

5. TIGRR - Unplaced last time, 3rd before that over 1900m at Deauville on July 28th in a Class 2 
handicap. Ought to be in the shake-up 

6. ALLURRE - Placed on her last two runs, the latter when 3rd over 1400m in a Class 2 handicap 
at Deauville on turf on August 22nd. Has won on the PSF before. One to pay attention too 

7. DEVIL IN THE SKY - Good 4th in a Class 1 handicap at Parislongchamp on September 8th. 
Previous course and distance winner. Can not be overlooked 

8. EMPATHIC - Unplaced last time, 3rd before that over 1400m in a Class 3 race at Le Lion 
D'Angers on August 9th. Opposable 

9. CENTRAL PARK WEST - 4th on the latest run over 1900m at Deauville in a Class 1 handicap 
on August 18th. Not ideally drawn in stall 16 

10. MY FANCY -  

11. KHOCHENKO - Two unplaced runs of late, 4th before that over 2000m at Parislongchamp on 
June 9th in a Class 2 handicap. Has won at this track over 2100m in 2021. Needs to be more 
reliable 

12. RAQEEBB - Unplaced on the last two runs, a decent 3rd before that over 2000m in a Class 3 
race at Saint-Cloud on May 25th. Has won on the PSF before. Player 

13. GIRAFFE - Has solid form all season so far, decent 3rd last time over 2000m at 
Parislongchamp in a Class 2 handicap on September 15th. Place chance 

14. AL KHAMSIN - 3rd last time, won before that at Deauville in a Class 3 handicap on August 
6th over 1600m. Others make more appeal 

15. NEPALAIS - Three unplaced runs of late, 3rd before that over 1800m in a Class 3 handicap 
at this track on turf on June 16th. Has won on the PSF. Outside place chance 

16. NOSDARGENT - Two unplaced runs of late, won before that over 1900m in a Class 3 
handicap at Deauville on July 28th. Needs a few to falter 
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Summary: RAQEEBB (12) could be worth taking a chance on in this open handicap. He will be 
value in the betting and has winning form on the PSF last year at Deauville. DEVIL IN THE SKY 
(7) is a threat and a previous course and distance winner last year. He ran a pleasing race on the 
turf when fourth in a Class 1 handicap at Parislongchamp last month. ALLURRE (6) is a winner 
on this surface before and is advisable as an each-way option. LORCAN (4) is also worth 
considering. 

SELECTIONS 

RAQEEBB (12) - DEVIL IN THE SKY (7) - ALLURRE (6) - LORCAN (4) 
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C2 - PRIX DE RULLY - 1100m (a5f1/2) - TURF - Class 3 Claiming - Flat - 

EUR € 19,000  

 
1. TATSTHEWAYTODOIT - Fair 2nd on his latest run over 800m in a Class 3 race at Chantilly on 
September 7th. Place chance 

2. TERRATINO FIRE - 3rd last time over 1500m at Mons-Ghlin (BEL) on September 8th on the 
PSF. Looks unlikely to feature 

3. IMPITOYABLE - 5th on his last two runs, the most recent over 1200m in a Class 2 handicap at 
Chantilly on September 16th. Among the leading place chances 

4. AVRILOMANOIR - Two unplaced runs recently, 3rd at Deauville before that on August 15th in 
a Class 2 handicap. Capable but can blow hot and cold 

5. KING ROBBE - Credible 4th on his latest outing over 1000m at Vichy in a Class 3 handicap. 
Won over 1100m in April in a handicap. Live contender 

6. BAILEYS BLUES - Fair effort when 5th in a Class 3 handicap over 1400m at Vichy on August 
19th on the latest outing. Has the speed to cope with the drop in trip 

7. ROGUE ENFORCER - Three unplaced runs this year, the latter over 1300m in a claimer at 
Saint-Cloud on September 9th. Best avoided 

8. CIAO PA' - Two unplaced runs of late, won before that over 1100m in a Class 4 race at Vichy 
on August 23rd. Can make the top three 

9. LA BELLE POETE - Won over 1200m last time at Mont-De-Marsan in a claimer on September 
14th. Form pick 

10. ANNASHABA - Three unplaced runs to date, the latest over 1400m at Parislongchamp on 
August 29th in a Class 3 claimer. Makes no appeal 

Summary: LA BELLE POETE (9) is top-rated and will be full of confidence after a win at Mont-
De-Marsan in the middle of September. She is preferred to BAILEYS BLUES (6) who has been 
competing in stronger races recently and shaped well in a Class 3 handicap in August when last 
appearing. CIAO PA' (8) looks one to side with from an each-way angle. KING ROBBE (5) is a 
winner over 1100m in April and is worth considering. 

SELECTIONS 

LA BELLE POETE (9) - BAILEYS BLUES (6) - CIAO PA' (8) - KING ROBBE (5) 
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C3 - PRIX DES TERROIRS DE FRANCE - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL WEATHER 

- Maiden Race - Flat - EUR € 20,000  

 
1. MAGIC FRANK - Well beaten on his debut over 1600m at Le Mans on September 13th in a 
maiden. Looks out of his depth 

2. GWO KA - Two unplaced runs so far, the latter over 1800m at Clairefontaine on August 9th in 
a maiden. Makes no appeal 

3. RHIPPER - 5th on his debut at Le Lion D'Angers over 1400m on August 4th on the only run so 
far. Should improve and has place claims 

4. MAGIC WAY - 7th on her debut at Deauville over 1500m on August 22nd in a maiden race. 
Hardly inspiring 

5. ZIA AGNESE - Has shown promise in three runs so far, the latter when 5th at Dieppe over 
1800m on August 27th. Consider 

6. ROSA GALLICA - Ran a promising debut when she was 3rd at Chantilly on turf on September 
16th over 1800m. Can improve and is ideally drawn in stall 1 

7. STAR OF LIGHT - Ran well on her debut when 2nd over 1600m at Saint-Malo on August 22nd 
on her sole start. Will be sharper for that run and has each-way claims 

8. SPRING LILY - Decent 2nd on her latest run over 1800m at Dieppe on August 27th on her 
third start. She is progressive and her experience is a positive 

9. BOHEMOS - Unplaced last time, 4th before that over 1600m in a maiden race at Vittel on 
August 18th. Others make more appeal 

10. RANJITH - Newcomer by Cloth Of Stars, the dam was placed on the flat. Will likely improve 
for this debut run. Watch the betting for clues 

11. INDALIMOS - Unraced filly by Cloth Of Stars, the dam won once and was placed in a Group 
3 race. From a leading stable that will have her well-tuned. Bold show likely 

12. FREED FROM DESIRE - Unraced filly by French Fifteen, the dam won one race over 
hurdles. Can be expected to improve for this run. Watch the betting for clues 

Summary: ROSA GALLICA (6) was an eye-catching third on her debut at Chantilly on turf last 
month. She will have learned a lot from that experience. Ideally drawn in stall one she can score 
from the experienced SPRING LILY (8) who has improved with each run and was a pleasing 
second at Dieppe in late August when last seen. INDALIMOS (11) has a nice profile and the 
Andre Fabre horses are in top form. STAR OF LIGHT (7) ran well when second at Saint-Malo and 
is not discounted. 

SELECTIONS 

ROSA GALLICA (6) - SPRING LILY (8) - INDALIMOS (11) - STAR OF LIGHT (7) 
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C4 - PRIX DU SALON DES CONDE - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL WEATHER - 

Class 3 Divided Handicap - Flat - EUR € 20,000  

 
1. THE CHOSEN ONE - Has dropped in the handicap with some unplaced efforts of late, but 
showed a hint of coming back to form when 7th at Clairefontaine in a Class 3 handicap on July 
31st over 1600m on the last outing. Place chance 

2. DARK ZEL - Has four unplaced efforts since a 4th over 1600m in a Class 3 handicap on July 
5th.  Hard to trust 

3. BREMONTIER - Credible effort when 4th over 2000m at Strasbourg on September 8th in a 
Class 4 handicap. One to pay attention too 

4. MOON RIDER - Has four unplaced runs since a 2nd over 1300m at Deauville in a Class 3 
handicap on August 8th. Makes no appeal 

5. PUERTA DEL SOL - Unplaced last time, 4th before that over 2100m at Mons-Ghlin (BEL) on 
September 8th. In the mix 

6. MAKTAVA - Good effort when 2nd at Parislongchamp on September 15th over 2000m in a 
Class 3 handicap. Likes the PSF. Live contender 

7. MADRAS - 3rd two runs back over 1600m in a Class 4 race at Rochefort-Sur-Loire on July 
21st. Has won one race from 35 runs and can be passed over 

8. LIDISBARN - Has been out of form recently. 6th over 2000m at Strasbourg on September 8th 
in a Class 4 handicap on the latest outing. Can be overlooked 

9. SEA WINGS - Has four unplaced runs of late, won before that over 1900m at Chantilly in a 
Class 4 handicap on March 14th. One to consider 

10. COEUR DE ROUME - Unplaced last time, won before that over 2000m at Vichy on 
September 8th in a Class 4 handicap. Can be competitive at nice odds 

11. RONALDO - Two unplaced runs of late, won before that over 2400m at Vittel on August 12th 
in a Class 4 handicap. Looks vulnerable 

12. LAUENEN - Unplaced last time, won before that over 1600m at Pompadour in a Class 4 race 
on August 25th. Has work to do 

13. BECH RIVER - Ran well when 3rd over 2400m at Lyon Parilly on September 17th in a Class 
4 handicap on the latest outing. Top four chance 

14. FIRST DREM - Has several unplaced runs of late, the latter over 2300m in a Class 4 race at 
Pompadour on September 8th. Opposable 

15. SILVER CONDOR - Unplaced on the sole run this year over 2100m in a Class 3 handicap on 
May 26th at Parislongchamp. Hard to recommend 

16. MAESTRO CHOP - Has shown no form for some time, well beaten at Parislongchamp in a 
Class 3 handicap on June 6th when last appearing. Best watched for now 
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Summary: MAKTAVA (6) ran a solid race at Parislongchamp in the middle of September when 
he was second-beaten narrowly. He can make amends and score on a surface he likes. COEUR 
DE ROUME (10) could be the one who gives the selection the most to think about. He is relatively 
lightly raced and should have a good bit more to come. BREMONTIER (3) looks like a good 
option for the each-way backers to latch on to. THE CHOSEN ONE (1) has dropped to a fair mark 
and could be dangerous. 

SELECTIONS 

MAKTAVA (6) - COEUR DE ROUME (10) - BREMONTIER (3) - THE CHOSEN ONE (1) 
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C5 - PRIX DU BOIS BRANDIN - 1800m (a1m1/8) - TURF - Handicap - Flat - 

EUR € 25,000  

 
1. AFTER MIDNIGHT - A winner in a Conditions race at Saint-Malo over 2500m on 24 July. First 
run in a handicap and can go close again 

2. CLASH ROYALE - Ran fourth in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 3 September. 
Stéphane Pasquier reunites and the last time they partnered was successful 

3. BEJAR - Unplaced in a Handicap at ParisLongchamp over 1600m on 26 May. Disappointing 
latest effort but can bounce back and play a minor role 

4. SAILAWAYWITHME - Ran well when third in a Conditions race at Compiegne over 1600m on 
17 September. Handicap debut and can make it a winning one 

5. PEPETE - Unplaced in a Handicap at Compiegne over 2000m on 28 August. Equipped with 
cheek pieces and the last time led to a victory 

6. MODERN LIGHT - A winner in a Handicap at this track over 1800m on 21 September. Has 
momentum and will try to confirm that. 

7. LERFAL - Fourth in a Conditions race at Dieppe over 1800m on 27 August. Handicap debut 
and the stable has a good track record at this level 

8. EEPHA - A winner in a Conditions race at La Roche-Possay over 1700m on 8 September. 
Improved latest effort and must confirm that 

9. MAGIC PERSEVERANCE - Finished 9th in a Handicap at Deauville over 1400m on 25 
August. Not in form and is best watched for now 

10. ANIELSKA - Fifth in a Handicap at Strasbourg over 2000m on 15 September. Mickaël 
Barzalona is in the saddle and will have supporters 

11. YSOIE - Finished 10th in a Handicap at Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 6 September.Poor last 
two efforts at this level 

12. SOMMERDANCE - Well beaten 8th in a Conditions race at Auch over 2000m on 8 
September. Needs to find a few lengths to be competitive 

13. LA DOLOISE - Unplaced in a Handicap at Clairefontaine-Deauville over 1800m on 28 June. 
Others are preferred in this line-up 

14. SUMMER FLIRT - Finished 8th in a Handicap at Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 6 
September.Yet to place and is an unlikely winner 

Summary: AFTER MIDNIGHT (1) has done little wrong in three career starts and looks a serious 
proposition on handicap debut. SAILAWAYWITHME (4) has been consistent without winning and 
seems to be on a workable mark on her first run in a handicap. Reunited with Stéphane Pasquier, 
CLASH ROYALE (2) cannot be dismissed lightly. MODERN LIGHT (6) has a five pounds penalty 
to defy after her last success but remains hard to ignore. 

SELECTIONS 

AFTER MIDNIGHT (1) - SAILAWAYWITHME (4) - CLASH ROYALE (2) - MODERN LIGHT 

(6) 
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C6 - PRIX DU SALON DE GUISE - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL WEATHER - 

Class 3 Divided Handicap - Flat - EUR € 22,000  

 
1. RECOLETTY - Finished 10th in a Handicap at Compiegne over 1800m on 17 September. 
Disappointing in the latest but has been competitive at this level before that and can be in the mix 

2. COGOLIN - A winner in a Handicap at Le Croisé-Laroche over 1800m on 19 September. Not 
out of it 

3. BIRIATOU - Finished 10th in a Claimer at ParisLongchamp over 1600m on 12 September. 
Third run back from a break and might still need it 

4. HADEWIN - Unplaced in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. Third run back 
from a break and might improve 

5. BELINSKOV - A runner-up in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. Maxime 
Guyon is in the saddle and will have many supporters 

6. TIMETOSHINE - Well beaten 7th in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud over 2000m on 13 
September. Others are preferred in this line-up 

7. ALCATOSER - Unplaced in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. Could be a 
surprise package of the race 

8. STEELHAMMER - Finished 10th in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud over 2100m on 6 May. 
Probably will be in need of a run 

9. EL MANIFICO - A runner-up in a Handicap at ParisLongchamp over 2000m on 15 September. 
Improved effort in the latest and must confirm that 

10. LE TROPIC - A winner in a Handicap at Deauville over 1900m on 22 August. Penalized 
2.5Kg for the latest victory but can be involved in the finish again 

11. PRESOMPTION - Fourth in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. In form and 
has sufficient means to fight for victory 

12. ZILRAK - Third in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. Holding form well 
and deserves to be respected. Track suited 

13. RESTLESS SPIRIT - Well beaten 7th in a Handicap at this track over 1600m on 3 
September. Moderate latest effort after winning the penultimate 

14. CAPTAIN DE CERISY - Unplaced in a Handicap at Deauville over 1900m on 4 August. 
Unplaced since winning at this track in May. 

15. KING OF TWIST - Finished 10th in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. 
Unplaced since winning at this track in April. Others are preferred 

16. KINGSFOLD - Unplaced in a Conditions race at Nantes over 1600m on 10 September. Poor 
form and is an unlikely winner 
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Summary: BELINSKOV (5) has been knocking at the door and makes a lot of appeal with 
MAXIME GUYON in the plate. PRESOMPTION (11) is on the rise and is a very smart performer 
on the fibersand so looks a serious proposition too. RECOLETTY (1)'s last run is best to be 
forgotten. She had previously shown that she is very competitive off her current mark. LE 
TROPIC (10) has a five pounds penalty to defy but ships a long way for the race so cannot be 
dismissed lightly. 

SELECTIONS 

BELINSKOV (5) - PRESOMPTION (11) - RECOLETTY (1) - LE TROPIC (10) 
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C7 - PRIX DU BOSQUET SAINT-ROMAIN - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL 

WEATHER - Claiming - Flat - EUR € 23,000  

 
1. FOUR WHITE - Finished 7th in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud over 2000m on 9 September. 
Moderate three efforts to date 

2. SOUS INFLUENCE - Third in a Conditions race at Saint-Malo over 1800m on 22 August. The 
only attempt in a Claimer resulted in a runner-up position 

3. KEEN APPROACH - Unplaced in a Handicap at this track over 1800m on 21 September. Well-
handicapped and can be involved in the finish 

4. MON FLAMANT - Fifth in a Handicap at Deauville over 1900m on 22 August. Needs to find a 
few lengths to be competitive 

5. BALI - Finished 10th in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud over 2000m on 13 September. Hard 
to trust but is capable of popping up 

6. CHARMILLE - Unplaced in a Claimer at Deauville over 1300m on 10 August. Had one poor 
effort in  a Claimer this year 

7. AQUAZZURA - A winner in a Conditions race at Lyon-Parilly over 1600m on 11 September. 
Can double up, first time in a Claimer 

8. CARTIMANDUA - A winner in a Conditions race at Lyon-Parilly over 1600m on 17 March. 
Long break and coming back in a Claimer. 

9. LALA LIGHT - Well beaten 8th in a Conditions race at ParisLongchamp over 1600m on 8 
September. Unplaced this year and is best watched for now 

10. NAXOS - Unplaced in a Handicap at Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 6 September. Others are 
preferred in this line-up 

11. LET ME DO - A winner on debut in a Conditions race at Saint-Malo over 1600m on 4 August 
last year. Long break but showed potential on debut 

12. ANTICO - Unplaced in a Claimer at Compiegne over 1400m on 20 August. Others are 
preferred in this line-up 

13. ANGEL IN THE SKY - Unplaced in a Handicap at Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 6 September. 
Poor form this year and others are preferred 

14. EMPRESS STAR - A winner in a Claimer at Compiegne over 2000m on 17 September. Won 
at this level in the latest and has momentum 

15. MON IDOLE - Unplaced in a Handicap at this track over 1800m on 21 September. needs to 
improve to feature 

Summary: AQUAZZURA (7) is a progressive filly that should be hard to beat on her first attempt 
in a claiming race. She gets the vote ahead of SOUS INFLUENCE (2) who finished 2nd in his 
only previous start in this division. A nice winner at Dieppe in the summer, BALI (5) takes a step 
down in grade and can leave behind his last two below-par efforts. CARTIMANDUA (8) had 
demonstrated ability in her early days and could be the each-way angle. 

SELECTIONS 
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AQUAZZURA (7) - SOUS INFLUENCE (2) - BALI (5) - CARTIMANDUA (8) 
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C8 - PRIX DU SALON VIOLET - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL WEATHER - Class 3 

Divided Handicap - Flat - EUR € 27,000  

 
1. HOLLYHOCK - Disappointed when unplaced in a Handicap at this track over 1600m on  3 
September.  A runner up in the previous two and is capable of contesting the finish 

2. COSMAS - Unplaced in a Handicap at ParisLongchamp over 2000m on 15 September. Two 
poor efforts after a break 

3. LETTY'S MARVEL - Unplaced in a Handicap at Deauville over 1900m on 17 August. Proven 
at this level and can be involved in the finish 

4. INKIOSTRO - Fourth in a Conditions race at Clairefontaine-Deauville over 1800m on  24 
August. Delphine Santiago is back in the irons and the two were successful at this track in 
December last year 

5. LA JAVANAISE - Unplaced in a Handicap at Deauville over 1900m on 6 July. Others are 
preferred in this line-up 

6. HENRY THE LION - A runner-up in a Handicap at Deauville over 1900m on 17 August. 
Consistently knocking and will get it right soon 

7. NASOMO - Fifth in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud over 2000m on 13 September. Meets 
HENRY THE LION (6) 3Kg better off and is unreliable 

8. APALAIN - Fourth in a Conditions race at Sablé-sur-Sarthe over 2850m on 15 September. 
Third run back from a break and will be fitter 

9. KAWARETH - A winner in a Claimer at this track over 1900m on 21 September. Can play a 
minor role 

10. TALK SHOW - A winner in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. Holding 
form and is not out of it 

11. OXALIS - Well beaten 8th in a Handicap at Toulouse over 2000m on 5 September. Needs to 
improve on the latest effort 

12. FUEGO DEL AMOR - Fourth in a Handicap at this track over 1600m on  3 September. 
Cheekpieces have been assisting. Can make the frame 

13. VAZIR - Third in a Conditions race at Clairefontaine-Deauville over 1800m on  24 August. 
Others are preferred in this line-up 

14. HARRISON POINT - Finished 9th in a Handicap at Deauville over 1900m on 17 August. Can 
improve on the latest effort 

15. SEIGNEUR - Fifth in a Handicap at Deauville over 1500m on 25 August. Place prospects at 
best 

16. APOLLON - Fifth in a Conditions race at Clairefontaine-Deauville over 1800m on  24 August. 
Needs to find a few lengths to be competitive 

17. MELBORA - Third in a Handicap at this track over 1900m on 7 September. Holding form and 
is well-weighted to put in a decent effort 
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Summary: HENRY THE LION (6) is a very consistent horse who is overdue another win. He 
should be able to  resume winning ways in this lucky last race. HOLLYHOCK (1) lacks 
consistency but has the required ability to win a race of this nature if he is in the mood. NASOMO 
(7) is an intriguing candidate that is well in the weight so warrants some consideration. In-form 
MELBORA (17) is well placed in the handicap and has a reasonable each-way chance. 

SELECTIONS 

HENRY THE LION (6) - HOLLYHOCK (1) - NASOMO (7) - MELBORA (17) 

 


