
          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

R5 TOULOUSE [R-H] 

 

C1 - PRIX DES CATALANS - 3500m (a2m1/4) - TURF - Condition Race - 

Hurdles - EUR € 26,000  

 
1. FOREST DU PECOS AA - Disappointing recent form on the flat and was 9th in a Conditions 
race last time out at Mont-de-Marsan over 2150m on 25 August. Capable of improvement trying a 
hurdle rac 

2. LONE TIME DU POUEY AA - Has improved with each run on the flat and was fourth last time 
out in a Conditions race at Pompadour over 2300m on 20 July. Returns from a break but is not 
out of it trying a hurdle race 

3. SHAKRIMA AA - A three-year-old filly by Shrek out of Shalima who is making her debut. 
Watch the betting trend 

4. FLAVO DE VERDUN AA - Has run well in both starts and was third last time out in a 
Conditions hurdle over this track and trip on 31 October. Big chance in this line-up 

5. LAURIKA DE LAGARDE AA - Not disgraced on her debut when 5th in a Conditions hurdle 
over this course and distance on 31 October. Should do better this time and is not out of it 

6. LORA DE LA BRUNIE AA - A three-year-old filly by Nicaron out of Colette de la Brunie who is 
making her debut. Watch the betting for clues 

7. PETIT RATON AA - A three-year-old gelding by Carghèse des Landes out of Sucaille who is 
making his debut. Watch the betting 

8. LUPIN D'OC AA - Only modest so far and was 6th last time out in a Conditions flat race at 
Agen-Le Passage over 2500m on 3 November. Capable of improvement trying a hurdle race 

Summary: An interesting race where newcomers could have the say. LORA DE LA BRUNIE AA 
(6) and SHAKRIMA AA (3)  are well enough bred and represent trainers that are capable of 
winning races with runners making their debut. FLAVO DE VERDUN AA (4) has been consistent 
so far and will have the benefit of hurdle experience so cannot be dismissed away easily. PETIT 
RATON AA (7) makes his debut and could contest the finish. 

SELECTIONS 

LORA DE LA BRUNIE AA (6) - SHAKRIMA AA (3) - FLAVO DE VERDUN AA (4) - PETIT 

RATON AA (7) 



          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

C2 - PRIX COLONEL AUBLET - 3500m (a2m1/4) - TURF - Class 3 Race - 

Hurdles - EUR € 26,000  

 
1. MADISON - Has improved with each start and was a winner last time out of a Conditions 
hurdle at Agen-Le Passage over 3600m on 3 November. Should fight out the finish 

2. KIRSEINEKO - Unreliable and was runner-up last time out in a Conditions hurdle at 
Fontainebleau over 3550m on 28 October. Can contest the finish 

3. LA SEULE FACON - Has improved of late and was fourth last time out in a Conditions hurdle 
at Fontainebleau over 3600m on 3 November. Not out of it 

4. KLARIX - Has improved with each run and was runner-up last time out in a Conditions hurdle 
at Saint-Brieuc over 3800m on 11 November. Can go one better this time 

5. ARIA DE BUJ - Did not show much on her first hurdle attempt when tenth last time out in a 
Conditions hurdle at Lyon-Parilly over 3400m on 31 October. Capable of improvement but others 
are preferred 

6. MAYBE THE STORY - Has only been modest so far and was 6th last time out in a Conditions 
hurdle at Saint-Brieuc over 3800m on 11 November. Might play a minor role 

7. CHACHECHOUET - Has improved with each run and was third on hurdle debut in a 
Conditions race at Agen-The Passage over 3600m on 3 November. Has a winning chance 

Summary: MADISON (1) is improving and won nicely last time out. She does set the standard of 
the race. CHACHECHOUET (7) was not disgraced when third and behind that selection last time 
out and can get close to beating her this time. KIRSEINEKO (2) is unreliable but was not 
disgraced at Fontainebleau and has a winning chance. LA SEULE FACON (3) has scope for 
further improvement and is not out of it. 

SELECTIONS 

MADISON (1) - CHACHECHOUET (7) - KIRSEINEKO (2) - LA SEULE FACON (3) 



          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

C3 - PRIX FRANCIS LOPEZ - 2000m (a1m1/4) - TURF - Handicap - Flat - 

EUR € 20,000  

 
1. JOHNNY HAMMER - Consistent so far and was fourth last time out in a Conditions race at 
Pau over this distance on 13 November. Can contest the finish again on handicap debut 

2. STARECTO - Always gives his best and was not disgraced when 5th last time out in a 
handicap at this course over 2400m on 11 November. Not out of it 

3. ALMANABAA - A winner of two of her four starts including last time out in a Conditions race at 
Marseille-Vivaux over 2600m on 9 October. Can follow up 

4. XILOFONO - A winner of three of his last four starts including last time out in a Claimer at this 
track over 2400m on 17 November. Has a place chance 

5. MISTER PRESIDENT - Knocking hard at the door and was runner-up last time out in a 
handicap over this course and distance on 11 November. Has a winning chance 

6. ZINGARELLE - Only modest of late and was 6th last time out in a handicap over this course 
and distance on 11 November. Might earn some minor money 

7. PASSEPARTOUT - - Consistent and was third last time out in a claimer at Agen-Le Passage 
over 1850m on 27 October. Could play a minor role 

8. EAGLE MOUNT - Holding form and was third last time out in a handicap over this track and 
trip on 11 November. Should be competitive once again 

9. BE A LORD - Has improved of late and was third last time out in a handicap at Cholet over 
1900m on 3 November. Has a place chance 

10. GOLDEN FLASH - Has improved of late and was third last time out in a handicap at Nancy 
over this distance on 17 November. Could play a minor role 

11. HOT IN FRONT - Unreliable but was a winner last time out in a Conditions race at Agen-Le 
Passage over 1850m on 27 October. Has struggled in handicaps of late 

12. SNATCHER - Disappointing of late and was 8th last time out in a handicap over this course 
and distance on 11 November. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

13. KIRBY - Did not show his best when tenth last time out in a handicap at this course over 
2400m on 11 November. Capable of better and could play a minor role 

14. LAZULITE - Holding form and was runner-up last time out in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over 
2400m on 15 November. Not out of it 

Summary: MISTER PRESIDENT (5) was narrowly beaten over this course and distance last time 
out. He can go one better this time. EAGLE MOUNT (8) is holding form and is sure to be 
competitive once again. JOHNNY HAMMER (1) is consistent and is clearly not out of it. 
ALMANABAA (3) has shown promise in her two wins and is proven on this surface so is another 
one to consider. 

SELECTIONS 

MISTER PRESIDENT (5) - EAGLE MOUNT (8) - JOHNNY HAMMER (1) - ALMANABAA (3) 



          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

C4 - PRIX HIPPIC MCDO FAMILY (PRIX DE DAX) - 2100m (a1m1/4) - TURF 

- Class 4 Claiming - Flat - EUR € 16,000  

 
1. DAYSHANN - A winner of two of his last three starts in Spain, including last time out at San 
Sebastian over 2200m on 1 September. Not out of it 

2. SIR ANTONINO - Bounced back to his best with a Conditions race win last time out at Mont-
de-Marsan over 2000m on 10 November. Can contest the finish 

3. NOIRE DESIRE - Unreliable and was 5th last time out in a handicap at Bordeaux-Le Bouscat 
over 1900m on 11 November. Has a place chance 

4. SUNFAST - Disappointing of late and was 5th last time out in this division at Saint-Cloud over 
2500m on 15 November.Capable of better and could be a threat 

5. PIANINO - Consistent in claimers and was third last time out at this track over 1600m on 17 
November. Can contest the finish yet again 

6. ROUGE - Has struggled of late and was 11th last time out in a handicap at this track over 
3000m on 24 November. Capable of an upset this distance 

7. LORNE - Unreliable but was not disgraced when third in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over this 
distance on 27 September. Has a winning chance 

8. ALCEDIMZOE - In good form of late and was runner-up last time out in a Conditions race at 
Mont-de-Marsan over 2000m on 10 November. Can contest the finis 

Summary: A tough race to find the winner. LORNE (7) has been unreliable but was not 
disgraced at Saint-Cloud last time out so should run well in this line-up. SUNFAST (4) is capable 
of better than the recent runs would suggest and does have a winning chance. DAYSHANN (1) 
has shown good form recently in Spain and is not out of it. SIR ANTONINO (2) won a nice race 
last time out and has to be given consideration. 

SELECTIONS 

LORNE (7) - SUNFAST (4) - DAYSHANN (1) - SIR ANTONINO (2) 



          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

C5 - PRIX GABRIEL SUAREZ D'ALMEYDA - 2000m (a1m1/4) - TURF - 

Claiming - Flat - EUR € 12,500  

 
1. READY TO GO - Fresh off a victory over 2000m at Durtal in a claiming race and can follow up. 
Expected to follow up 

2. BLEKOU - A son of Blek out of a Compton Place mare that more than likely will be unfancied 
on debut. Prefer others 

3. JONH LEMON - Has shown absolutely nothing in two runs thus far and will need huge 
progression before being considered for any bets. No 

4. BOUDAY SERERE - He ran near last in 15th place on debut over 1400m at Pau and cannot 
be selected on that effort alone. Pass by 

5. GRECIAN RULER - Lightly raced, will need to improve on latest effort when only finishing 6th. 
Needs to improve for the win but can place 

6. FEEL THE HEAT - Finished 6th on debut and never progressed in second start when finishing 
11th over 2000m at Pau. Hard to like 

7. DIMANCHE SOIR - Still a maiden, finished 4th over 1500m in a claimer at Marseille Vivaux 
last time and has an each way chance 

8. BOREALE - Finished back of the field in 15th last time and is therefore hard to fancy. Can 
easily be overlooked 

9. GHIZLENE - Has run three times and gone backward in finishing positions. Last run was at 
Pau. Would be a shock winner 

10. GANSTA LOVE - Can improve on debut 8th place finish over 2000m at Angers on the 18th of 
November. Outside quartet chance at best 

11. PROMESSE - Much better effort last time when 3rd over 2000m in a claimer at Durtal. Can 
be expected to place again 

12. SANDON - Lightly raced, placed 4th over 2000m at Durtal last time and can deliver much 
more here. Has a good place hance 

Summary: READY TO GO (1) brings healthy form into the race and was a winner at Durtal early 
last month. She is selected to follow up. DIMANCHE SOIR (7) is still seeking the maiden win but 
did show some spark last time when finishing fourth. Should win soon. PROMESSE (11) 
managed to place third in the last run and, in this field, can place again. SANDON (12) has a first 
four chance and is a must for the quartet. 

SELECTIONS 

READY TO GO (1) - DIMANCHE SOIR (7) - PROMESSE (11) - SANDON (12) 



          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

C6 - PRIX JEAN PECOUT - 2400m (a1m1/2) - TURF - Class 4 Handicap - 

Flat - EUR € 14,000  

 
1. KATE DADDY - Ignore last run when 8th over 1900m on the 22nd of last month and expect 
way more. Can do better and has a place chance 

2. DON'T WATCH ME CRY - Running fairly well, placed 3rd over 2500m at Saint-Cloud on the 
27th of October and can race fresh and well. Big place chance 

3. PHILOSOPHY - Ten time winner, finished 2nd over 2400m at Nantes in a Handicap on the 1st 
of November and can go one more. Win choice 

4. SANCHO - Taking time to win again, finished 4th over 2600m last time and can earn money 
again for the connections. Outside place claims 

5. LONG KE WAN - Placed 3rd over 2450m at Mont-De-Marsan on the 16th if November and will 
need to do more for the win but can place 

6. VIKING CITY - Can build on last local run when 9th over 2400m at Toulouse and must be 
respected and included in all bets 

7. GAMECHANGER - Finished 3rd three starts back but has been average since. Prefer others 
for the shortlist and would be a shock winner 

8. LANCEUR D'ALERTE - Will need to progress on last run when 7th over 2400m at Toulouse. 
Others are preferred and selected for the bets 

9. TIGRE ROUGE - Boasts solid, consistent form and has a huge chance. Good last run when 
2nd over 2400m at Toulouse. Big runner 

10. JARDIN BLEU - Current form has been on the decline over various trips and tracks and is 
hard to make a case for 

11. COCOA - Impressed when winning last start which was on the 11th of last month over 2400m 
at Toulouse in Handicap class. Good chance 

Summary: PHILOSOPHY (3) knows how to race and knows how to win, he has done it ten times 
already and is selected to make it eleven, after this. He finished a good 2nd over 2400m at 
Nantes in a Handicap last time and is confidently selected to go one better. DON'T WATCH ME 
CRY (2) has shown in her last two starts that she is itching to achieve another win. Strong each 
way claims. KATE DADDY (1) can be expected to do way better than her recent 8th finish and is 
given a bright place chance. VIKING CITY (6) is a must for all bets. First four claims. 

SELECTIONS 

PHILOSOPHY (3) - DON'T WATCH ME CRY (2) - KATE DADDY (1) - VIKING CITY (6) 



          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

C7 - PRIX D'AGEN - 1600m (a1m) - TURF - Class 4 Claiming Handicap - 

Flat - EUR € 13,000  

 
1. ROI DE L'AIR - Was a winner at the last start which was at Amiens over 1650m in a weak 
claimer. Is tipped to follow up 

2. DANCE AHEAD - Ignore last run when finishing 10th at Toulouse over 1400m in a Handicap. 
Judge on better earlier form but others are preferred 

3. PORTOFINO - Finished 2nd in Madrid over 1600m in October and might need a race or two to 
tighten up. Can be overlooked 

4. PIANO MAN - Finished 2nd three starts back and has been average since but can do way 
better. Good chance 

5. ZEYZOUN - Boasts a recent victory at Toulouse over 1600m and can follow up.  Looks a 
serious player in this class of event 

6. GRECIAN STAR - Is a tad erratic, finished 12th last time, 2nd before that over 1800m in a 
Handicap at Lyon La Soie and must be respected on that run alone. Chance 

7. MORELLO DI VENTO - Is still a maiden, finished way back last time and is therefore hard to 
fancy. Unlikely winner. Best to overlook 

8. CODE OF SILENCE - Finished 7th over 1400m in a Handicap at Toulouse on the 24th of 
November and will need to serve up more than that to threaten here. Can one passed over 

9. HEART SHINING - Only managed 8th place last time when racing at Lyon La Soie over 1800m 
and much more is needed to win this. Hard to like 

Summary: ROI DE L'AIR (1) was victorious at the last time of asking over 1650m at Amiens 
albeit in a weak claiming race. His overall form is solid and he might take a ton of beating in this. 
Strong win choice. ZEYZOUN (5) comes into the race fresh off a victory at Toulouse and it would 
come as no shock at all, if following up. PIANO MAN (4) has shown some fair form before but the 
last two deliveries have been a bit below best. Expect better this time and include. GRECIAN 
STAR (6) has a first four claim. 

SELECTIONS 

ROI DE L'AIR (1) - ZEYZOUN (5) - PIANO MAN (4) - GRECIAN STAR (6) 



          SUNDAY, 01/12/24 

 

C8 - PRIX DE LA MEDITERRANEE - 2000m (a1m1/4) - TURF - Class 4 Race 

- Flat - EUR € 14,000  

 
1. CADE'S - Has won his last two and will be a serious force to be reckoned with here. 
Undeniable hat trick chance and cannot be excluded from anything 

2. AGAMEMNON - In tremendous form, won penultimate and followed up with an attractive 2nd 
over 2900m in a Handicap. Has a strong winning chance 

3. AMARHALEN - Last two placed efforts were encouraging and might well be able to represent 
some value for the minor positions 

4. LA YOMOGUINESS - Can progress on last run when 5th at Croise-Laroche over 2500m, but 
will need too. Outside place claims at best 

5. BURWASH - Much better run last time when 3rd over 1900m in a Handicap and can be taken 
seriously here for another place. Place chance 

6. COMTESSE VERA - Finished 5th over 1850m at Agen in a Handicap last month but will need 
to do way more than that to feature. Best to overlook 

7. REMIX - Much better run last time when 4th over 1900m in a Handicap. Good each way 
chance 

8. CORO CHOP - Running well, placed a creditable 2nd over 1900m in Handicap class at Cholet 
on the 3rd of last month and has a bright chance 

9. FINEHA - She is taking time to win again, finished 4th last time and could lurk into the back 
end of the quartet but others are preferred 

10. PRINCESSE VERA - Hard to fancy and make a case for on current form and others should 
be way stronger. Hard to make a case for 

Summary: AGAMEMNON (2) is currently in mustard form and looks to be the one they all have 
to fear the most. His last run over 1900m on the 5th of November was very encouraging. He was 
a winner before that. The one to beat. CADE'S (1) has won his last two in fine style and has an 
obvious undeniable hat trick chance. CORO CHOP (8) is taking time to achieve the first victory 
but current form suggests that the win is near. Big runner with strong each way claims. 
BURWASH (5) cannot be excluded from any bets and should run into the money positions. 

SELECTIONS 

AGAMEMNON (2) - CADE'S (1) - CORO CHOP (8) - BURWASH (5) 

 


