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C5 - PRIX DU CENTRE LECLERC MENNEVAL - 2800m (a2m) -  - Harness - 

EUR € 50,000  

 
1. IVANJICA DE LOU - Disqualified in a class F at Savigny-sur-Braye over 3500m on 9 June. 
The penultimate start was the winner and is capable of bouncing back 

2. ISEULT FLOWER - In good form this year having won three times, in the latest was fourth in a 
class E at Graignes over 2725m on 30 May. Faces stronger but is difficult to rule out 

3. HELIOS SOMOLLI - Unplaced in a class E at Amiens over 2900m on 13 June. Probably 
needed the last start and might still need it 

4. INDUS VAL - He is in a purple patch of form, the latest was a runner-up in a class E at 
Graignes over 2725m on 30 May. Trying the grass surface and if he takes to it can go one better 

5. FLORALYSE D'AUTHOU - Finished 5th in a class F at Chartres over 2825m on 30 June. She 
is unlikely to be the winner 

6. GOMERA - Fair effort when fourth in a class E at Agen-Le Passage over 2575m on 15 June. In 
May was second in a stage of this challenge and has a winning chance. Reverts to barefoot 

7. HUNE LOVE - Unplaced in a class F at Moulins-la-Marche over 2700m on 30 June. Can play a 
minor role at best and reverts to barefoot 

8. GALA DE CRENNES - He showed some improvement when fourth in a class A at Sablé-sur-
Sarthe over 2800m on 30 June. Held his own in the round contested last week. 

9. FANFARONNEUR - Has disqualification issues and in the latest was disqualified in a class E 
at Toulouse over 2950m on 6 June. A penultimate-start winner and can bounce back 

10. GAZ D'OCCAGNES - Disqualified in a class B at Marseille-Borely over 2300m on 17 May. He 
has placed twice in four attempts this year and can play a minor role 

11. HERADAMES - A runner-up in a class C at Vincennes over 2700m on 14 June. Seldom far 
off them and deserves to be respected 

12. FEE LUCERNAISE - Unreliable of late and was 9th in a class C at Vincennes over 2700m on 
14 June. Remains barefoot and is capable of popping up in a place if in the mood 

13. GEF DE PLAY - Finished 7th in a class A at Vincennes over 2850m on 14 June. He has lost 
his way and is best watched for now 

14. INVICTUS MADIBA - Finished 6th in a class C at Beaumont de-Lomagne over 2550m on 25 
May. A consistent sort that could be suited to the grass track 

15. IMPRESSIONIST - Fluffed his lines when disqualified in a class A at Vincennes over 2850m 
on 23 June. He must be wise and needs to show more 

16. GIBUS - Finished 8th in a class B at Vincennes over 2850m on 31 May. Others are preferred 
in this line-up 

17. FEE DE RANCHVAL - Unplaced in a class B at Cavaillon over 2525m on 18 June. Unplaced 
in seven attempts this year and others are much preferred 
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18. FINE PERLE OF LOVE - Unplaced in a class A at Niort over 3550m on 23 June. Poor form 
and others are preferred in this line-up 

Summary: This ninth stage of the Green Trophy promises to be competitive. Trying the grass 
surface INDUS VAL (4) is in fine form and if the grass is suitable, can go close again. GOMERA 
(6) is barefoot and should challenge for top honours. FANFARONNEUR (9) is not easy to trust 
but deserves respect. INVICTUS MADIBA (14) is seldom far off them, along with  HERADAMES 
(11) and both could be competitive. A very open looking race 

SELECTIONS 

INDUS VAL (4) - GOMERA (6) - FANFARONNEUR (9) - INVICTUS MADIBA (14) 

 


