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R1 VINCENNES [L-H] 

 

C1 - PRIX CLEOMEDE - 2700m (a1m1/2) - Class D Race - Harness - EUR € 

59,000  

 
1. INVICTUS DE HOERDT - Scored his 3rd success of the summer when tenaciously staying on 
to win a 2150m Mauquenchy Class E last week but is being asked to do too much this time 

2. ILLICO DES BAUX - 9th of 13 in a 2700m Class D at La Capelle earlier in the month and is 
properly out of his depth 

3. ICONE D'AVENIR - Sanctioned, on return to competition, in a 2150m Mauquenchy Class E 
late-July. Tricky sort but has twice won over course and distance, comes here fresh and barefoot, 
and will have her supporters 

4. ISOFOU DU CHENE - Fine 2nd of 13 in a 2850m Class B on re-entry here on 21 August. 
Completed a hat-trick of victories here during the winter and can return to successful ways on his 
first objective of the new season 

5. IVOIRE PRESTANCE - Surprise 4th in 6 September race of reference. Has merit but on this 
occasion appears to have too much to do 

6. GAROU DU CHENE - Respectable but unthreatening 5th of 15 in a 2100m Class E here 3 
weeks ago but, in this category, will need to find considerably more 

7. IRIS FROM - Winner at Saint-Jean-de-Monts before coming close 2nd of 11 in a 2475m Royan 
Class E on 25 August. Excels for Alexandre Abrivard and will justifiably garner significant support 

8. IGUANE DE CAPONET - Unlucky 3rd of 9, a place behind IACYNTHE DIDJEAP (10), in a 
2850m Class D here 2 weeks ago, but can more than make amends if Yoann Lebourgeois keeps 
him out of trouble 

9. INTOUCHABLE - 5th of 9, behind IACYNTHE DIDJEAP (10), in a 2850m Class D here 2 
weeks ago. Races barefoot for the occasion but has not lived up to his name for over a year 

10. IACYNTHE DIDJEAP - Good 2nd of 9 in a 2850m Class D here a fortnight ago. Can prove a 
handful but has otherwise been on a good run of form and is not going to be far off the mark 

11. IMPERATOR D'ELA - Completed the hat-trick before being headed in a competitive 2775m 
Craon Gr.3 2.5 weeks ago. Has nothing to prove under these conditions, enjoys a fine entry, and 
can bring home the bacon 

12. IRON JET - 7th behind IMPERATOR D'ELA (11) in a 2775m Craon Gr.3 2.5 weeks ago. 
Raced better that day than the result would suggest and drops back in category with a decent 
chance of making first 5 

Summary: A force to be reckoned with when barefoot and focused, IMPERATOR D'ELA (11) 
missed out by little on a 4-timer in a turf Gr.3 recently and, winner under these conditions last 
time here, looks the pick of the field. Anthony Barrier will still have concerns about the barefoot 
ISOFOU DU CHENE (4) who made an excellent comeback here a month ago, and IGUANE DE 
CAPONET (8) who was not the luckiest here earlier in the month. As solid as a rock since 
returning from her break, IRIS FROM (7) excels in the day's configuration and is not going to be 
far from the action. 
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SELECTIONS 

IMPERATOR D'ELA (11) - ISOFOU DU CHENE (4) - IGUANE DE CAPONET (8) - IRIS 

FROM (7) 



          FRIDAY, 20/09/24 

 

C2 - PRIX EUCHARIS - 2175m (a1m1/4) - Class C Race - Harness - EUR € 

46,000  

 
1. EMY STECCA - Sanctioned in a monté Class C over course and distance 3 weeks ago. Has 
done little of note since coming to France and will have few takers 

2. ERMES EFFESSE - Back under harness after finishing last of 7 in a monté Class C over track 
and trip late-August and, even racing barefoot, has no possible chance 

3. ERES DORIAL MAIL - Takes his first steps north of the Alps after running 2nd of 4 finishers 
over 2060m in Turin earlier this month. Sports front pads for the first time and, although not a 
contender, is still worth keeping an eye on 

4. TROGIR - Quality German type that lost his action in 2640m Gr.1 Swedish Derby at  Jägersro 
on 1 September. Stays shod for his French debut but still warrants respect 

5. EMPIRE AS - Has not been seen out since trotting 2nd of 13 in a 2850m Class D here 3.5 
months ago but will have been specifically prepared for this and should take all the beating 

6. NOAH NEWPORT - Returns to Paris after coming 5th of 10 in 1900m German Derby a month 
ago. Barefoot for first time at Vincennes but others still easier to back 

7. KHALEESI D'ALESA - 2nd at Cherbourg before faulting in a 2100m Class D here a week ago. 
Showed her form that day but appears to be biting off more than she can chew this time 

8. KAIROS DE BOMO - Sanctioned early on return to competition 10 days ago, but is a colt with 
ample ability and can play a leading role if Charley Heslouin keeps him trotting 

9. KULTA - Made it 2 wins on the trot when securing a 2700m Class D here a fortnight ago, her 
2nd straight success with Franck Nivard reining, and must be taken more seriously 

10. EVERY TIME WINNER - Returns to Paris after winning a brace at home in Milan, latterly over 
a mile. Appreciates Vincennes conditions and is not to be underestimated 

11. KAKO GASCOGNE - Steps back up the class-ladder after winning a 2100m claimer here, 
with room to spare, late last month. Makes first start for new yard, with Benjamin Rochard reining, 
and is unlikely to be far from the action 

Summary: Jean-Michel Bazire has taken over the training of EMPIRE AS (5) after he ran a big 
race on his Vincennes debut in early-June and, even though unseen since, he goes barefoot for 
the occasion and can get straight down to business. Leading the opposition is KAIROS DE 
BOMO (8) who sports a new configuration following his much-need comeback run, and the Italian 
EVERY TIME WINNER (10) who returns on a hat-trick to a track he likes. Back at the top of his 
game, KULTA (9) similarly vies for the 3-timer and will not be sent out at 22/1 this time around. 

SELECTIONS 

EMPIRE AS (5) - KAIROS DE BOMO (8) - EVERY TIME WINNER (10) - KULTA (9) 
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C3 - PRIX EROS - 2700m (a1m1/2) - Class D Race - Harness - EUR € 

40,000  

 
1. KRYSTEL SEVEN - Makes first appearance since faulting in a monté Class C over course and 
distance last January. Shoes on and no danger 

2. KRONA VIKING - Useful sort that finished 4th of 11 in a 2050m Cabourg Class D on 23 
August. Takes on better here but has hind shoes off for first time and should not be entirely 
written off 

3. KOUMBA MESLOISE - Imposed at Argentan before being sanctioned in a 2750m Cabourg 
Class E mid-August. Races shod this time and will have other priorities 

4. KUNZITE D'EM - Sanctioned, when unsupported, in a 2700m Class D at La Capelle 3.5 weeks 
ago. Has been out of sorts all year and can be passed over 

5. KISMIE DE MONTFORT - Pleased under harness at Cabourg before coming 2nd of 12 in a 
2200m monté Class E here a fortnight ago, but chances still limited 

6. KEY TO THE HIGHWAY - 3rd of 11 in a Class E over course and distance 3 weeks ago. Is 
plainly close to her race and has every chance of imposing 

7. KINOU DAB - 7th of 9, on 2nd start back, in a Class D over course and distance 2 weeks ago. 
Champion driver at the helm this time and is in with a realistic shout 

8. KATARINA DE LOU - Difficult filly that encouraged somewhat at Vire earlier in then month, 
coming 5th of 13 in a 2800m Class E. Entrusted to Franck Nivard for first time but represents little 
more than a minor place chance 

9. KARVINA D'ELA - Missed out by little for the hat-trick late-July, when 2nd of 10 in a 2650m 
Saint-Galmier Class E. Won in this configuration at Amiens and with Gabi Gelormini reining this 
time, can play a leading role 

10. KALISCA DE LA LEUE - Back at the top of her game after a difficult start to the year, most 
recently winning a 2725m Pornichet Class E late last month. Has never disappointed for Anthony 
Barrier and is unlikely to start now. First 5 

11. KAHINA DE LATZ - Has shown improvement since changing configuration, latterly 5th of 9 in 
a 2050m Cabourg Class D on 23 August, but can nonetheless expect to have her work cut out 

12. KAMA D'EM - In the frame in last 2, most recently 2nd of 11 in a 2100m Class E here a 
fortnight ago, and with with Yoann Lebourgeois back in the bike, will be no pushover 

13. KARA DE PIERREPONT - Sanctioned in last 2, most recently a 2100m Class D here late last 
month. Has no love for the main track and, even fitted with a fresh formula, will have little to 
contribute 

14. KALIFA MESLOISE - Lost her way earlier in the year and has picked up after the break 
where she left off, latterly 11th of 13 in a 2800m Vire Class E 2.5 weeks ago. Hind shoes off this 
time but still not easy to make a case 

15. KAPELLA DRY - Made up for 3 straight sanctions with a fast-finishing 3rd of 9 in a 2950m Le 
Mans Class E last week. Already 3 times a winner for Paul Ploquin and can pick up another 
cheque if he keeps her trotting 
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16. KORA DE BLARY - Reassuring 5th, a place behind KAHINA DE LATZ (11), in a 2050m 
Cabourg Class D on 23 August. Enjoys a good entry and has a reasonable chance of getting in 
on the action 

Summary: Much more of a professional since starting to race unshod-all-4, KEY TO THE 
HIGHWAY (6) would arguably have finished closer here recently with a better trip, but Alexandre 
Abrivard takes over and can finally get her off the mark. That being said, Eric Raffin's services 
have been engaged for the useful KINOU DAB (7) who races barefoot for the first time. Excellent 
in all 3 starts over the summer, KARVINA D'ELA (9) sports a new configuration for her Vincennes 
debut and is unlikely to go down easily. Beaten only by a very good horse on her recent bow at 
the venue, KAMA D'EM (12) should again prove competitive for a place. 

SELECTIONS 

KEY TO THE HIGHWAY (6) - KINOU DAB (7) - KARVINA D'ELA (9) - KAMA D'EM (12) 
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C4 - PRIX ELSA - 2700m (a1m1/2) - Class C Race - Harness - EUR € 53,000  

 
1. JETPACK - Made up for his Argentan sanction with a solid 4th to JAGUAR D'OBRET (10) in a 
2100m Class D here 3.5 weeks ago. Barefoot this time but others still preferred 

2. JACK SURPRISE - Waited 30 months for victory, winning at La Rochelle late-July, only for 
another to come around a month later, flying up in a 2700m Class D at La Capelle 3.5 weeks ago, 
and looks a decent first-5 chance 

3. JOYEUX MESLOIS - Back under harness after faulting in a monté Class D over course and 
distance a fortnight ago, and has no possible chance 

4. JALDO D'OCQUE - No slouch on a good day and most recently 3rd of 12 in a 2900m Arras 
Class E a month ago, but in this category will have limited prospects 

5. JACK DES MALBERAUX - Reassuring 5th of 9 in a 3000m Châteaubriant Class D earlier this 
month, but did not do enough to be considered a player 

6. JOLI MANNEQUIN - Quality type that took no time getting back in shape after the break, 
coming 2nd of 12 in a 2700m Vittel Class H conditioner mid-August. Seldom disappoints when 
focused here and is competitively well-in 

7. JASMIN DU VALLON - Made it 3 sanctions from 4 starts this term when faulting in a 3000m 
Châteaubriant Class D 12 days ago. Is confirmed with Franck Nivard though and can impose if he 
keeps his charge trotting 

8. JOKER DES CHALIERS - Quality element making first start since winning a 2100m Class C 
here last February. Just front pads fitted and will need the race 

9. JOLIVERT DU GERS - Last of 12 in a 2750m Ecommoy Class B conditioner on 8 September. 
Seldom lets the side down when barefoot and focused and is not to be overlooked 

10. JAGUAR D'OBRET - Like a horse reborn since returning to racing barefoot, most recently 
winning a 2100m Class D here 3.5 weeks ago. Eric Raffin maintains faith and for legitimate 
reason. Possible spoiler 

11. JUPITER TURGOT - 2nd of 11 in a 2800m Class B at Le Croisé-Laroche 11 days ago. 
Barefoot for the occasion, with JMB drafted in to assure continuity, and must be treated with 
considerable respect 

12. JINGLE LOVER - Solid 2nd of 15 in a 2875m Enghien Class D mid-August. Races barefoot 
again and Paul Ploquin can be confident of a big run. Chance 

13. JAPPELOUP TURGOT - 10th of 12 when prepping for this in a 2750m Ecommoy Class B 12 
days ago. Has bags of ability though, is a winner under these conditions, and must be taken 
seriously 

14. JOKER D'OCCAGNES - Easily won a 2700m Class D at La Capelle earlier in the month. Has 
little Vincennes experience but has already won for Alexis Collette and is not to be 
underestimated 
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Summary: As tricky as they get and perhaps not as sharp as he was earlier in his career, 
JASMIN DU VALLON (7) has nevertheless been reunited with Franck Nivard and can win this if 
he stays in stride. Significantly more dependable and clearly enjoying a fine run of form, JINGLE 
LOVER (12) returns to Vincennes a live chance. Excellent at Vittel on his return from a long 
layoff, JOLI MANNEQUIN (6) boasts a decent record at the venue and is unlikely to disappoint. 
JOKER D'OCCAGNES (14) enjoys a good entry, has won 2 of his last 3, and must be afforded 
respect. 

SELECTIONS 

JASMIN DU VALLON (7) - JINGLE LOVER (12) - JOLI MANNEQUIN (6) - JOKER 

D'OCCAGNES (14) 
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C5 - PRIX ARTEMIS - 2700m (a1m1/2) - Class C Race - Mounted - EUR € 

46,000  

 
1. KENTUCKY DU CAIEU - Well-regarded type racing barefoot for return to the discipline, latterly 
10th of 12 in a harness Class D over course and distance 2.5 weeks ago, but is unlikely to spring 
a surprise 

2. KELLY D'ESSARTS - Makes first appearance since coming 3rd of 11 in a 2950m Pornichet 
Class F on 12 July. Is barefoot for the occasion but cannot be considered a player this time 
around 

3. KATCHINA FOR CLARA - Showed courage to dead-heat with KANDISSIME (11) in a Class D 
over course and distance 3.5 weeks ago. In better company this time but is plainly on the right 
path and must be considered a contender 

4. KALINE DES RIOULTS - Returns to the ridden code on a fine run of form, coming 2nd of 9 in 
a 2150m Cagnes harness Class D a month ago, but in this company will have too much to do 

5. KALIMERO JASMA - Has 2 runs under his belt since the break, latterly last of 14 in a 2100m 
Class D harness conditioner here 10 days ago. Barefoot for his monté 3-timer and looks the 
horse to beat 

6. KALISTA JIEL - 3rd at Cabourg on monté debut before coming in a tenacious winner of a 
2250m Enghien Class D on 11 August. Unlikely to shake things up this time but is still worth 
keeping an eye on 

7. KING STALLION - Won 2 from 3 before flopping to 7th of 8 in a 2875m Enghien Class D early-
August. Not the easiest to handle but won over track and trip last April and, on good behaviour, 
can get a look-in 

8. KING TEJY - Hard to fault lately, most recently coming 2nd to KORRIGAN OLIVERIE (9) in a 
Class D over course and distance 3.5 weeks ago. Not a priority this time but should at least be 
able to hold his own 

9. KORRIGAN OLIVERIE - Enjoying something of a renaissance, winning his last 2, latterly a 
Class D over course and distance 3.5 weeks ago, with consummate ease, and will have his 
chances 

10. KILOVE DU GOUTIER - Scored her 3rd success of the season 11 days ago, holding on in a 
2400m Class D at Beaumont-de-Lomagne. Races left-handed for just 2nd time but can play a 
role if she takes to the new profile 

11. KANDISSIME - Back on track following 4 consecutive sanctions, most recently dead-heating 
with KATCHINA FOR CLARA (3) in a Class D over course and distance 3.5 weeks ago and, with 
application, can get in on the action 

12. KENTUCKY IDEAL - Makes first start since finishing 8th of 12 in a harness Class C under 
these conditions 3 months ago. Is more than capable in this branch of the business though and, 
barefoot for the occasion, must be respected 

13. KAPITAN D'HERIPRE - 4th of 6 when preparing for this in a 2925m Cagnes harness Class C 
on 17 August. Has a lot going for him here and looks a serious proposition first time under the 
saddle 
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Summary: A host of horses in the running here but the nod must nevertheless go to KALIMERO 
JASMA (5) who returns to the discipline unbeaten when barefoot. Benjamin Rochard can still 
expect to feel the heat from the superbly-engaged monté debutant, KAPITAN D'HERIPRE (13) 
who is reunited with Alexandre Abrivard for the occasion, and KORRIGAN OLIVERIE (9) who 
returns to the venue on a hat-trick. Since moving to Charley Mottier's yard, KATCHINA FOR 
CLARA (3) has started to make good on her promise and steps up in class with a legitimate 
chance of confirming her latest success. 

SELECTIONS 

KALIMERO JASMA (5) - KAPITAN D'HERIPRE (13) - KORRIGAN OLIVERIE (9) - 

KATCHINA FOR CLARA (3) 
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C6 - PRIX LACADEIRA - 2700m (a1m1/2) - Class E Race - Harness - EUR € 

35,000  

 
1. L'AVIS DU CHAILLOU - Takes a big step up in category after winning a 2500m Class F at La 
Chartre-sur-le-Loir a month ago, and is quite simply being asked to do too much 

2. LIBERATOR PHEDO - Back under harness after coming 6th of 11 in a 2850m Laval monté 
Class E 2 weeks ago, and is not about to spring any surprises 

3. L'ARTISTE MIL - Sanctioned in a 2550m Dieppe Class E earlier in the month. Has otherwise 
been in good shape and sports front pads this time, but the step up in category may be a step too 
far 

4. LIKE MENCOURT - Won at Saint-Omer last month before coming 4th of 6, following some 
capricious behaviour, in a 2100m Class E here 2.5 weeks ago, but is still unlikely to improve on 
that 

5. LATINO LA MAZURE - 6th of 7, behind L'ECLAIR DE PLAY (10), in a 2150m Mauquenchy 
Class E last week, and will have few friends 

6. LUSANIO DE WARNOC - In the thick of things in first 5 starts before being the subject of 
interference in a 2150m Mauquenchy Class E 8 days ago. If kept out of trouble though, his place 
is in first 5 

7. LORD MIL - Made short work of a 2750m Class F at La Ferté-Vidame a month ago, on first 
start since March. Comes to Vincennes with morale intact and will be no soft touch 

8. LENNON DU VIVIER - Put a trio of sanctions behind him to win a 2900m Amiens Class E, in 
good order, a fortnight ago, and has every chance of repeating, provided his budding driver keeps 
him trotting 

9. LARABELLO DE LOU - Would have won a 2650m Class E at Divonne-les-Bains a month ago 
had he not stumbled in the final stages. Has shown a more consistently-performant side since 
starting to race with front pads and is not about to disappoint 

10. L'ECLAIR DE PLAY - Decent colt that put in quite the finish, despite a delayed final run, to 
come 5th of 7 finishers in a 2150m Mauquenchy Class E last week, and Franck Blandin will be 
eager to set the record straight 

11. LICAR SOMOLLI - Yet to open his account but was not far off the mark when 2nd in a 2050m 
Cabourg Class E on 23 August, and Mathias Dudouit will be keen to take advantage of the good 
entry 

Summary: Although still somewhat green, there is little doubt about the potential LENNON DU 
VIVIER (8) has shown and, with front pads fitted, and stride in check, he can complement his 
recent Amiens victory. In the bike this time, Clément Duvaldestin will be keeping a watchful eye 
on the well-engaged pair of LICAR SOMOLLI (11) who is plainly close to his race, and L'ECLAIR 
DE PLAY (10) who is in considerably better shape than his recent performance would imply. 
Winner on his comeback last month, LORD MIL (7) steps up in category but will sport front pads 
and be reined by Franck Nivard for the first time. 

SELECTIONS 

LENNON DU VIVIER (8) - LICAR SOMOLLI (11) - L'ECLAIR DE PLAY (10) - LORD MIL (7) 



          FRIDAY, 20/09/24 

 

C7 - PRIX LYRA - 2700m (a1m1/2) - Class E Race - Harness - EUR € 35,000  

 
1. LILY FLEUR - Has not been seen out since trotting 4th of 6 in a 2400m Eauze claimer 3.5 
months ago and will have nothing to contribute 

2. LILIE D'OMAHA - Made up for her July sanction when 3rd of 9, a place behind LOUISIANE 
(10), in a 2725m Pornichet Class E a month ago. Front pads fitted for first time and, with 
application, will not be going home empty-handed 

3. LUCY DU RILER - Got off the mark in a 2475m Francheville Class F mid-August but, 
considering the opposition, will struggle to repeat 

4. LADY DU VALLON - Took some time to come to hand but makes her Vincennes debut on a 
hat-trick, latterly winning a 2000m Rambouillet Class F 12 days ago. Franck Nivard keeps the 
faith and will be expected to finish in the mix 

5. LYNDA CASTEL - Capricious sort but has bags of untapped potential. Will have come on for 
her 4th of 10 on re-entry in a 2100m Class E here a fortnight ago and will be expected to contest 
the finish 

6. LEXOVIENNE - Improving sort making first start since winning a 2400m Amiens Class E early-
June, but is likely to need the outing 

7. LOLITA DE LANDEMER - Steps back up in category after running 2nd of 10 in a 2150m 
Enghien claimer mid-August. Reverts to racing with hind pads fitted but others still preferred 

8. LILY MARGOT - Quickly sanctioned in a 2150m Mauquenchy Class E last week but was by 
some margin better than the opposition and can redeem herself if she gets off on the right foot 

9. LADY MAGALOU - Won a 2700m Graignes Class F early last month, with a certain ease, and 
even though in more exalted company this time, still looks a serious player 

10. LOUISIANE - 2nd of 9 in a 2725m Pornichet Class E a month back. Eric Raffin keeps the 
drive and while not a priority can nevertheless get in on the action 

11. LAPONIE D'EMMA - Made it 2 successes on the trot when comfortably winning a 2950m 
Saint-Malo Class F on 13 August. Races left-handed for first time and will have her chances if 
she takes to the new profile 

12. LILOU D'ATOUT - Unremarkable 6th of 9 in a 2700m Class E at La Capelle, on return from 
her spell, 3.5 weeks ago. Placed just once in 3 racing left-handed and others easier to back 

Summary: A progressive filly, LILY MARGOT (8) was quickly sanctioned last time out but 
nevertheless showed she had the measure of the field and, confirmed with Gabi Gelormini, can 
set the record straight. It will not be all plain sailing though given how well LYNDA CASTEL (5) 
performed on her recent return to competition. Unbeaten in 2 starts to date, LADY MAGALOU (9) 
steps up in class but the hat-trick is still a possibility. Given a short rest after a disappointing 
debut, LAPONIE D'EMMA (11) went on to win 2 in a row and will be no easy touch if she turns. 

SELECTIONS 

LILY MARGOT (8) - LYNDA CASTEL (5) - LADY MAGALOU (9) - LAPONIE D'EMMA (11) 
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C8 - PRIX AQUITANIA - 2200m (a1m1/2) - Class C Race - Harness - EUR € 

38,000  

 
1. MANAMA D'ORLY - Pleased on debut 12 days ago before coming last of 7 in last week's race 
of reference, and can be ruled out 

2. MARBOXIE D'HERIPRE - Quickly sanctioned in 13 September race of reference. Alexandre 
Abrivard takes over the reins and can make their presence felt if he assures her initial strides 

3. MOSAIC LIFE - Quality home-bred going left-handed for first time after a trio of provincial 
conditioners, latterly sanctioned in a 2325m Bréhal Class G 2 months ago. Comes here fresh, 
reined by a leading driver, and if applied can win this 

4. MARBELLA - Unlucky 4th of 7 in a 2150m Class D at Les Sables-d'Olonne a month back, but 
can more than redeem herself if Benjamin Rochard keeps her out of trouble 

5. MISSY PERRINE - Got off the mark at Montier-en-Der last month before finishing 6th of 8 in a 
2225m Ecommoy Class C on 8 September and, even with Franck Nivard reining, cannot be 
considered a priority 

6. MY HAPPY STORY - Unthreatening 2nd of 5, on debut late-August, in a 2050m Cabourg 
Class D. Will have progressed for the run but represents no more than a minor place chance 

7. MONEGASQUE - Defied her odds to come 3rd of 7 finishers in a Class D over track and trip a 
week ago, and must be taken more seriously this time around 

8. MIDNIGHT MOLLY - Won a 2000m Class E at La Capelle earlier this month, at first time of 
asking. Unlikely to repeat but can still get a look-in 

9. MAGDALENA - Ran 2nd at Cabourg before coming 5th of 7 in a Class D over course and 
distance a week ago. Is significantly better than that though and looks main danger to MOSAIC 
LIFE (3) 

Summary: Obviously capable but sanctioned in 2 of 3 so far, Philippe Allaire entrusts MOSAIC 
LIFE (3) to Yoann Lebourgeois for her metropolitan debut and can come out a winner if he can 
keep her trotting. The main threat is expected to come from MAGDALENA (9) who should 
logically turn the tables on MONEGASQUE (7) who had her measure here last week. 

SELECTIONS 

MOSAIC LIFE (3) - MAGDALENA (9) - MONEGASQUE (7) - MARBELLA (4) 

 


