
          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

R3 FONTAINEBLEAU [L-H] 

 

C1 - PRIX GEORGE BRIDGLAND (PRIX DE LA TOUCHE AUX MULETS) - 

1800m (a1m1/8) - TURF - Newcomers Race - Flat - EUR € 30,000  

 
1. SANDY EAGLE - A two-year-old filly by The Grey Gatsby out of Roussane who is making her 
debut. Watch the betting 

2. LIGHT THE GHOST - A two-year-old filly by Waldgeist out of Light The Stars who is making 
her debut. Watch the betting 

3. HIGHARA - A two-year-old filly by Latrobe out of Higha who is making her debut. Watch the 
betting 

4. YUKAI - A two-year-old filly by Iffraaj out of Semariya who is making her debut. Watch the 
betting 

5. LADY MADELEINE - A two-year-old filly by Waldgeist out of Annabel's Choice who is making 
her debut. Watch the betting 

6. QUEEN OF SCIENCE - A two-year-old filly by Le Havre out of Mary Somerville who is making 
her debut. Watch the betting 

7. GOLDYGIRL - A two-year-old filly by The Grey Gatsby out of Goldy Honor who is making her 
debut. Watch the betting 

8. WASSAIL - A two-year-old filly by War Front out of Wonderment who is making her debut- 
Watch the betting 

9. IUSTITIA CEN - A two-year-old filly by Justify out of Hollywood Glory who is making her debut. 
Watch the betting 

Summary: Trainer Yegada Centurion continues to shine with the juveniles and IUSTITIA CEN (9) 
is well bred and gets a narrow vote to score. WASSAIL (8) has been supplemented for this race 
so deserves the utmost respect. QUEEN OF SCIENCE (6) represents a trainer that knows what 
is needed to win on debut. Francis-Henri Graffard sends out YUKAI (4) and she will also not be a 
surprise winner. Watch the betting as all of them are making their debut. 

SELECTIONS 

IUSTITIA CEN (9) - WASSAIL (8) - QUEEN OF SCIENCE (6) - YUKAI (4) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C2 - PRIX DU MONT PIERREUX - 1800m (a1m1/8) - TURF - Newcomers 

Race - Flat - EUR € 30,000  

 
1. DALAKIR - A two-year-old colt by Zarak out of Daltama who is making his debut. Watch the 
betting 

2. LIBYAN KNIGHT - A two-year-old colt by Kingman out of Nadia Promise who is making his 
debut. Watch the betting 

3. BERTUTEA - A two-year-old gelding by Beaumec de Houelle out of La Vertu who is making 
his debut. Watch the betting 

4. MASCULINISTE - A two-year-old gelding by Johnny Barnes out of Baie des Fleurs who is 
making his debut. Watch the betting 

5. PONTOS - A two-year-old gelding by Intello out of Perpetual Glory who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

6. KILLARY KING - A two-year-old gelding by Hunter's Light out of Lady Speedy who is making 
his debut. Watch the betting 

7. BOUSSANT - A two-year-old gelding by Dariyan out of Astrale C who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

8. MAYAMAR - A two-year-old gelding by Ectot out of Nekhbet who is making his debut. Watch 
the betting 

9. KAWAALOT - A twp-year-old colt by Camelot out of Qawaasem who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

10. MONZON - A two-year-old colt by Almanzor out of Ironique who is making his debut. Watch 
the betting 

11. SHABRACK - A two-year-old gelding by Shalaa out of Brasileira who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

12. AVIDE - A two-year-old colt by Dubawi out of Plumania who is making his debut. Watch the 
betting 

Summary: They are all making their debut so the betting will be the best guide. DALAKIR (1) is a 
well bred colt that looks likely to shine. AVIDE (12) is a Dubawi colt and would not be a surprise 
winner. MONZON (10) is out of a GR.3 winner and could be a threat. SHABRACK (11) has 
already been gelded and is one of a few more that catch the eye on breeding. 

SELECTIONS 

DALAKIR (1) - AVIDE (12) - MONZON (10) - SHABRACK (11) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C3 - PRIX CONTESSINA - 1100m (a5f1/2) - TURF - Class 1 Race - Flat - 

EUR € 38,000  

 
1. LE CADEAU - Did not show his best when tenth last time out in a Group 3 at Chantilly over 
1200m on 26 October. In good form before that and has a winning chance 

2. KING ROBBE - Unreliable and was 6th last time out in a handicap at Lyon-Parilly over 1350m 
on 8 November. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

3. UN INSTANT - Very consistent and was runner-up last time out in a Conditions race at 
Bordeaux-Le Bouscat over 1400m on 5 November. Should contest the finish again 

4. CIAO PA' - Holding his form and was fourth last time out in a Conditions race at Lyon-Parilly 
over 1000m on 8 November. Might play a minor role at best 

5. LESSLEPASSER - Hard to trust but was victorious last time out in a Conditions race at Lyon-
Parilly over 1000m on 8 November. Picked up a 6 point penalty for that win 

6. LE TABOU - Very consistent of late and was third last time out in a Listed race at Deauville 
over 1400m on 3 November. Big chance in this line-up 

7. LA ROCHETTE - Has struggled of late and was 9th last time out in a Listed race at 
ParisLongchamp over 1400m on 20 October. Capable of better but others are preferred 

8. DAIQUIBERRY - Unreliable but was runner-up last time out in a Conditions race at Lyon-
Parilly over 1000m on 8 November. Can go one better this time 

Summary: LE CADEAU (1) flopped in Group company last time out but wil be a serious threat to 
these rivala and can bounce back to score. LE TABOU (6) ran well when third in a Listed race 
last time out and should challenge for top honours. UN INSTANT (3) is consistent and should be 
competitive yet again. LESSLEPASSER (5) loves this track and has a winning chance as well. 

SELECTIONS 

LE CADEAU (1) - LE TABOU (6) - UN INSTANT (3) - LESSLEPASSER (5) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C4 - PRIX CHLORIS - 2600m (a1m1/2) - TURF - Gr2 APQS Race - Flat - 

EUR € 51,000  

 
1. JESUBA - Returned to form with a good win at Saint-Cloud last time out over 2500m on 27 
October. Should fight out the finish 

2. KARINA SWEEN - Not disgraced when 5th last time out in a Conditions hurdle at Compiegne 
over 3600m on 3 October. Has won twice on the flat but more is needed to beat these rivals 

3. JOAQUINA DICI - Very consistent and was third last time out at Saint-Cloud over 2500m on 
27 October. Not out of it 

4. KISS ME SONNE - In good form and was fourth last time out at Saint-Cloud over 2500m on 27 
October. Can contest the finish again 

5. JUSTUNE STAR - A runner-up in her last two starts, with the latest being at Saint-Cloud over 
2500m on 27 October. Has a winning chance 

6. JIMFA - Disappointing form of late and was 5th last time out at Saint-Cloud over 2500m on 27 
October. Might play a minor role 

7. KAHULA - Has not done much wrong in four starts, winning twice, including last time out at 
Saint-Brieuc over 2400m on 27 October. Tackles stronger this time 

8. JOKE - Did not show her best when 7th last time out at Saint-Cloud over 2500m on 27 
October. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

Summary: JESUBA (1) beat a number of these when scoring at Saint-Cloud last time out. He 
has a big chance of following up. KAHULA (7) has not done much wrong so far and was an 
impressive winner at Saint-Brieuc last month. JUSTUNE STAR (5) was not disgraced behind rival 
in this JESUBA (1) last time out and should fight out the finish again. JOAQUINA DICI (3) is very 
competitive and can make the frame. 

SELECTIONS 

JESUBA (1) - KAHULA (7) - JUSTUNE STAR (5) - JOAQUINA DICI (3) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C5 - PRIX JACQUES DE VIENNE - 2600m (a1m1/2) - TURF - Gr1 APQS 

Race - Flat - EUR € 70,000  

 
1. LOUIS BANBOU - Has some fair form and was fourth last time out in a GR.3 at Nantes over 
2400m on 1 November. Can play a minor role 

2. LE TEMPS PRECIS - Runner-up on debut in a Conditions race at Argentan over 2400m on 9 
Octobr. Might play a minor role 

3. LEK WILL - Still improving and was third last time out in a GR.3 at Lyon-Parilly over 2400m on 
29 September. Capable of making the frame 

4. LINO BALL - A three-year-old gelding by Rail Link out of Nessy de Chadzeau who is making 
her debut. Watch the betting 

5. LUKALEO - Very consistent so far and was runner-up last time out in a GR.2. at Saint-Cloud 
over 2500m on 14 October. Be right there at the finish 

6. LOUISA BANBOU - A winner of her first two starts and was not disgraced when third in a 
GR.3 at Nantes over 2400m on 1 November. Has a winning chance 

7. LOUBA - Tries her best and was 5th last time out in a GR.3 at nantes over 2400m on 1 
November. Has a place chance 

8. LILI STAR - Yet to win a race but was 5th last time out in a GR.2 at Saint-Cloud over 2500m 
on 14 October. Needs to do a bit more to win 

9. L'ETONNANTE SWEEN - Continues to improve and was a GR.2 Winner last time out at Saint-
Cloud over 2500m on 14 October. Big chance 

10. LADIVA SMART - A winner of two of her five starts so far and was runner-up last time out in 
a GR.3. at Nantes over 2400m on 1 November. Can contest the finish again 

11. LILI BALL - Not disgraced when fourth last time out in a GR.2 at Saint-Cloud over 2500m on 
14 October. Has a place chance 

12. LANNILIS - A winner of her second start, a Conditions race at  Paray-le-Monial over 2400m 
on 10 November. Tougher task this time 

Summary: L'ETONNANTE SWEEN (9) continues to impress and was a good winner over rival in 
this race LUKALEO (5) at Saint-Cloud last month. That does look the best form on show and both 
these two runners can fight it out. LADIVA SMART (10) ran well at Nantes earlier this month and 
can be competitive again. LOUISA BANBOU (6) has not done much wrong so far and could have 
more to offer. 

SELECTIONS 

L'ETONNANTE SWEEN (9) - LUKALEO (5) - LADIVA SMART (10) - LOUISA BANBOU (6) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C6 - PRIX CERES - FONDS EUROPEEN DE L'ELEVAGE - 1400m (a7f) - 

TURF - Listed Race - Flat - EUR € 52,000  

 
1. ETEL DU NINIAN - Has really struggled of late and was 15th last time out in a handicap at 
ParisLongchamp over 1400m on 6 October. Needs major improvement to win 

2. EMBRACE - Has struggled of late and was 8th last time out in a Listed race at Newmarket 
over 1200m on 12 October. Makes little appeal 

3. KIMI ORENDA - Unreliable and was 6th last time out in a Conditions race at Deauville over 
1400m on 3 November. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

4. ASHIYMA - A winner of two of her three starts, including a Conditions race last time out at 
Cholet over 1350m on 7 October. Could play a minor role 

5. RUN AWAY - Holding form and was third last time out in a Listed race at ParisLongchamp 
over 1400m on 20 October. Has a place chance 

6. TEERAN - Did not show her best when tenth last time out in a Listed race at ParisLongchamp 
over 1400m on 20 October. Capable of better but others are preferred 

7. GERBERA - Did not show her best when 9th last time out in a Gr.3 at Chantilly over 1200m on 
26 October. In good form before that and has a winning chance 

8. TULIPA CHOPE - A winner of three races last year but did flop when 15th in a Group 1 at 
ParisLongchamp over 1600m on 12 May. Returns from a break but has a winning chance 

9. ABSTRACT - Unreliable but was not disgraced when fourth last time out in a Listed race at 
ParisLongchamp over 1400m on 20 October. Capable of making the frame 

10. MATAARIKI - Not disgraced when third last time out in a Conditions race at Curragh over 
1400m on 3 November. Can contest the finish 

11. LEXINGTON BELLE - Holding form and was runner-up last time out at Munich-Riem over 
1300m on 12 October. Could play a minor role 

12. MELON TWIST - Very consistent so far and was runner-up last time out in a Listed race at 
ParisLongchamp over 1400m on 20 October. Not out of it 

13. DYPTIQUE - Has lost her way of late and as 9th last time out at Baden-Baden over 1400m on 
31 August. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

14. MISS OXFORD - Showed what she is capable of with a Conditions race win last time out at 
Clairefontaine-Deauville over 1400m on 25 October. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

15. THIENE - Ha struck form with three wins in a row, the latest in a handicap at ParisLongchamp 
over 1400m on 20 October. Tougher task this time 

16. SUNNY ANGEL - Not disgraced when 5th last time out in a Listed race at ParisLongchamp 
over 1400m on 20 October. Could earn some minor money 

17. MAY - Always tries her best and was fourth last time out at Milan over 1600m on 14 
September. Needs to do a bit more to win 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

18. QUEEN OF MOUGINS - Has only won once so far but is very consistent and was runner-up 
last time out in a Listed race at Ascot over 1400m on 5 October. Be right there at the finish once 
again 

Summary: A very competitive, QUEEN OF MOUGINS (18) has only won just the one race so far 
but is consistent and could be ready to score. TULIPA CHOPE (8) did not show her best in a 
GR.1. last time out but could be a threat returning from a break. MELON TWIST (12) is 
threatening another victory and is distance suited. GERBERA (7) is better than her last run would 
suggest and has a winning chance. 

SELECTIONS 

QUEEN OF MOUGINS (18) - TULIPA CHOPE (8) - MELON TWIST (12) - GERBERA (7) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C7 - GRAND PRIX DE FONTAINEBLEAU - FONDS EUROPEEN DE 

L'ELEVAGE - 2000m (a1m1/4) - TURF - Listed Race - Flat - EUR € 52,000  

 
1. GOT A LOT - Has not shown much in two starts and was 6th last time out at Meydan over 
1600m on 24 February. Likely to need this run returning from a break 

2. DAYDREAM EXPRESS - Has already won three times this year and was third last time out at 
Baden-Baden over 1800m on 18 October. Not out of it 

3. INVISIBLE FRIEND - Unreliable but was not disgraced when runner-up last time out in a 
handicap at Haydock Park over 2040m on 5 Septembe 

4. PERSIST - Disappointing recent form and was 7th last time out in a GR.3 at Toulouse over 
2100m on 11 November. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

5. ALBANY - Improving and was a handicap winner last time out at Nottingham over 2050m on 
16 October. Can score again 

6. KARRIEWHITCHIT - Did not show her best when 7th last time out at Milan over 3000m on 26 
June. Capable of better and could make the frame 

7. SOME SKYE - Showed what she is capable of with a good win last time out in a Conditions 
race at Clairefontaine-Deauville over 1800m on 25 October. Can double up if in the same mood 

8. QUE BELLA - Disappointing last run when 8th in a Conditions race at Lyon-Parilly over 2400m 
on 8 November. Has ability and is capable of an upset 

9. DJHANSY - Not disgraced when fourth last time out in a handicap at Clairefontaine-Deauville 
over 2400m on 22 October. Could play a minor role 

10. EXPECTED ARRIVAL - Did not show her best when 5th last time out in a handicap at 
Kempton Park over 2200m on 2 October. Has a winning chance in this line-up 

Summary: SOME SKYE (7) has taken some time to win a first race. She did, however, win well 
enough to suggest she can follow up. ALBANY (5) is improving and can go one better on a good 
last run at Nottingham. DAYDREAM EXPRESS (2) has won three races in Germany this year 
and has a winning chance. KARRIEWHITCHIT (6) can improve back in France and is clearly not 
out of it. 

SELECTIONS 

SOME SKYE (7) - ALBANY (5) - DAYDREAM EXPRESS (2) - KARRIEWHITCHIT (6) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C8 - PRIX MERCEDES-BENZ GROUPE AUTOSPHERE (PRIX DE LA MARE 

AUX CORNEILLES) - 3000m (a2m) - TURF - Class 3 Divided Handicap - 

Flat - EUR € 23,000  

 
1. AUEN ADVENTURE - On a very long losing run and was 8th last time out in a handicap at 
Nancy over this distance 27 October. Capable of better and ha s a winning chance 

2. SHANGHAI SPIRIT - Very unreliable but was third last time out in a handicap over this track 
and trip on 14 November. Not out of it if repeating that run 

3. HAPPY CHRISNAT - Has struggled of late and was 13th last time out in a handicap over this 
course and distance on 14 November. Probably better over a shorter distance 

4. ROCKMAR - A winner of three of his last four starts, including a handicap over this course and 
distance last time out on 14 November. Carries a 3kg penalty and can score again 

5. GOT SEA - Yet to win a race but was not disgraced when fourth last time out in a handicap at 
Saint-Cloud over 2400m on 15 November. Can upset 

6. JEWEL DE CERISY - Has some fair of late and was 5th last time out in a handicap over this 
course and distance on 14 November. Has a place chance 

7. I'M ON MY WAY - Unreliable and was 7th last time out in a handicap at Lyon-Parilly over 
2400m on 8 November. Capable of playing a minor role 

8. NIGHTDANCE MAN - Did not show his best when tenth last time out in a handicap over this 
track and trip on 14 November. In good form before that and has a winning chance 

9. JONH FOR ALWAYS - Has lost his way of late and was 9th last time out in a handicap at 
Lyon-La Soie over 2400m on 4 November. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

10. CARDINALE - Yet to win a race but was runner-up last time out in a handicap at Amiens over 
2200m on 6 November. Can contest the finish 

11. LE HOULME - Has really struggled of late and was 16th last time out in a handicap at 
Strasbourg over 2350m on 11 November. Others are much preferred 

Summary: A very competitive handicap and only a few can be written off from winning. AUEN 
ADVENTURE (1) likes this track and is clearly better than the last run would suggest. Perhaps he 
can break a long losing streak. NIGHTDANCE MAN (8) struggled over this track and trip last time 
out but does have a winning chance. CARDINALE (10) has yet to win a race but did run well last 
time out. SHANGHAI SPIRIT (2) ran well over this course and distance last time out and can do 
even better this time. 

SELECTIONS 

AUEN ADVENTURE (1) - NIGHTDANCE MAN (8) - CARDINALE (10) - SHANGHAI SPIRIT 

(2) 



          SATURDAY, 23/11/24 

 

C9 - PRIX DU BELVEDERE DES DRUIDES - 3000m (a2m) - TURF - Class 2 

Divided Handicap - Flat - EUR € 30,000  

 
1. LET THERE BE ROCK - Not disgraced when 5th last time out in a handicap at Lyon Parilly 
over 2400m on 18 October. Has a winning chance 

2. FLORA QUEEN - Did not show her best when 6th last time out in a Conditions race at 
Deauville over 2500m on 8 November. Distance suited and can contest the finish 

3. TURANIA - Unreliable and was 14th last time out in a handicap at ParisLongchamp over 
3100m on 20 October. Capable of a surprise if at best 

4. ACT OF WISDOM - In good form and has won two of last four starts, with the latest being in a 
handicap at Bordeaux-Le Bouscat over this distance on 26 October. Carries a penalty but does 
have a place chance 

5. LA TEMPLIERE - Disappointing of late and was 11th last time out in a handicap at Saint-Cloud 
over 2500m on 27 October. Capable of better and has a place chance 

6. QUEEN ZARA - Did not show her best when 9th last time out in a handicap at Strasbourg over 
2350m on 11 November. Better this distance and has a winning chance 

7. BLACK HAWK - Showed some improvement when runner-up last time out in a claimer at 
Deauville over 2500m on 9 November. Needs to do more to beat these rivals 

8. WARELIA - Unreliable and was 6th last time out in a claimer at saint-Cloud over 2500m on 15 
November. Won in that division before that but others are preferred 

9. SOUND OF SIXTIES - Yet to win a race and was 6th last time out in a handicap at Lyon-Parilly 
over 2400m on  8 November. Will like this longer distance and is not out of it 

10. KALEONA - Holding form nicely and was fourth last time out in a handicap at 
ParisLongchamp over 3100m on 20 October. Be right there at the finish 

11. BADEN ROCKS - At best at Strasbourg and was 5th last time out in a handicap over 2350m 
on 11 November. Might play a minor role 

Summary: KALEONA (10) remains in good form and ran well over a similar distance at 
ParisLongchamp last month. She could be the right one for a competitive lucky last race. FLORA 
QUEEN (2) is better this distance and the last run is safely ignored. QUEEN ZARA (6) is also 
better this trip and should be a threat. SOUND OF SIXTIES (9) has yet to win a race but was not 
disgraced on handicap debut and should have more to offer. 

SELECTIONS 

KALEONA (10) - FLORA QUEEN (2) - QUEEN ZARA (6) - SOUND OF SIXTIES (9) 

 


