
          THURSDAY, 24/10/24 

 

R3 DEAUVILLE [R-H] 

 

C1 - PRIX DES ARCADES - 1300m (a6f1/2) - ALL WEATHER - Class 2 Race 

- Flat - EUR € 27,000  

 
1. BATWAN - Has lost his way of late and was well beaten last time out in a handicap at 
ParisLongchamp over 1000m on 6 October. Tries a lot further this time 

2. RAKAN - Has already won five times this year, including last time out in a Conditions race at 
Chantilly over this distance on 12 October. Deserves the utmost respect 

3. GAME RUN - Unreliable but was runner-up last time out in a handicap at Chantilly over 1200m 
on 16 September. Can make the frame 

4. OMICRONE - Did not show her best when 8th last time out in a Group 3 at ParisLongchamp 
over 1400m on 15 September. Has won on this surface and is not out of it 

5. PEDRITO - Disappointing recent runs and was 6th last time out in a handicap at 
ParisLongchamp over 1300m on 6 October. Capable of better and has a winning chance 

6. SIAM PARAGON - Is in good shape and was third last time out in a Conditions race at Saint-
Cloud over 1500m on 9 September. Big chance back on the PSF 

7. ICE CLIMBER - Finished 5th on debut in a Conditions race at Fontainebleau over 1400m on 
22 September. Capable of improvement but others are preferred 

8. SEE YOU PINK - Has struggled of late and was tenth last time out in a handicap at Deauville 
over 1400m on 22 August. Others are preferred 

Summary: SIAM PARAGON (6) is in very good shape. He also has an impressive record at this 
track and sets the standard for the race. RAKAN (2) has been good all year and will not go down 
without a fight. PEDRITO (5) has been a bit of a disappointment of late and does have a winning 
chance. GAME RUN (3) is unreliable but is also capable of contesting the finish. 

SELECTIONS 

SIAM PARAGON (6) - RAKAN (2) - PEDRITO (5) - GAME RUN (3) 
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C2 - PRIX DU PRE D'AUGE - 1300m (a6f1/2) - ALL WEATHER - 

Newcomers Race - Flat - EUR € 30,000  

 
1. SIR CRATER - A two-year-old colt by Earthlight out of Forest Maiden who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

2. BELL BOY - A two-year-old colt by Dream Ahead out of Zazie Top who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

3. FRANCESCOLI - A two-year-old gelding by  Hello Youmzain out of Vikala who is making his 
debut. Watch the betting 

4. OLYMPIC JACK - A two-year-old colt by Camacho out of Por Eso who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

5. TOOGOODTOBEROOD - A two-year-old colt by Zelzal out of Pandora's Star who is making 
his debut. Watch the betting 

6. UNFOLD - A two-year-old colt by Invincible Spirit out of Fizzi Top who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

7. LUFFY - A two-year-old colt by Wooded out of Dardania who is making his debut. Watch the 
betting 

8. HERACLES - A two-year-old colt by Muhaarar out of Champenoise who is making his debut. 
Watch the betting 

9. CITY TOWN - A two-year-old filly by City Light out of Madame Chow who is making her debut. 
Watch the betting 

10. PAX ROMANA - A two-year-old filly by  Siyouni out of Miryale who is making her debut. 
Watch the betting 

11. TXIRIMIRI - A two-year-old filly by Hello Youmzain out of Princesa who is making her debut. 
Watch the betting 

12. SAMOILOVA - A two-year-old filly by Night of Thunder out of Lady Galore who is making her 
debut. Watch the betting 

13. KOHANA - A two-year-old filly by Hello Youmzain out of Keegsquaw who is making her 
debut. Watch the betting 

14. NEHIAT - A two-year-old filly by Threat eout of Nehalennia who is making her debut. Watch 
the betting 

15. SELF MADE - A two-year-old filly by Waldpfad out of Nona who is making her debut. Watch 
the betting 

Summary: All newcomers. UNFOLD (6) represents a strong jockey-trainer combination and 
catches the eye on breeding too. LUFFY (7) is well bred and would not be a surprise winner. 
Under Maxime Guyon the filly PAX ROMANA (10) is clearly ready to wun and deserves the 
utmost respect. SIR CRATER (1) has been supplemented for the race and could also be a threat. 

SELECTIONS 
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UNFOLD (6) - LUFFY (7) - PAX ROMANA (10) - SIR CRATER (1) 
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C3 - PRIX DE VILLEPELEE - 1500m (a7f1/2) - ALL WEATHER - Class 2 

Race - Flat - EUR € 28,000  

 
1. TEN HORNS - In good form and was fourth last time out in a Conditions race at Lyn-Parilly 
over 1600m on 29 September. Can contest the finish again 

2. ALABAMA MOON - Disappointing last two runs and was 7th last time out in a Group 3 at this 
course over 1400m on 9 April. Could surprise returning from a break 

3. BRIO - Unreliable and was 7th last time out in a handicap at Chantilly ovcer 1900m on 3 
October. Needs to find a few lengthys to win 

4. MEMPHIS TENNESSEE - Disappointing last run when 7th in a Listes race at Chantilly over 
1600m on 29 June. Has a winning chance returning from a break 

5. MCTENETT - In good form and was third last time out in a Conditions race at Cholet over 
1350m on 7 October. Has a place chance 

6. GEORGES VILLE - Unreliable and was 5th last time out in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud 
over 1600m on 20 September. Can make the frame 

7. CI MER - In good form and was runner-up last time out in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud 
over 1600m on 20 September. Can go one better 

8. GRACELLA - On the up and was a winner of a handicap last time out at Compeigne over 
1400m on 17 September. Not out of it 

9. MME JOURDAIN - Broke the ice with a conditions win at this track over 1900m on 29 
November 2023. Has a winning chance if fit from the break 

10. SOLINAH - Did not show her best when 7th last time out in a Conditions race at Saint-Cloud 
over 1600m on 20 September. Capable of better and has a winning chance 

11. NADELIA - Mostly modest form of late and was 6th last time out in a Conditions race at this 
track over 1400m on 1 August. Others are preferred 

Summary: CI MER (7) is in good form. She is fit and should make a bold bid at scoring. MME 
JOURDAIN (9) showed promise in her three starts last year but is returning from a lengthy break 
so her fitness will need to be taken on trust. TEN HORNS (1) is in good shape and can be very 
competitive once again. SOLINAH (10) is better than her last run would suggest and can make 
the frame. 

SELECTIONS 

CI MER (7) - MME JOURDAIN (9) - TEN HORNS (1) - SOLINAH (10) 
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C4 - PRIX DU CHATEAU D'AUVERS-SUR-OISE - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL 

WEATHER - Claiming - Flat - EUR € 26,000  

 
1. SHOWPOWER - Non runners 

2. WELCOME CHARLY - In good form and was third last time out in a handicap at Toulouse over 
1600m on 2 October. Should be competitive once again 

3. PURPLE MOOD - Did not show his best when 8th last time out in a handicap at Chantilly over 
this distance on 3 October. Likes this track and trip and can bounce back to score 

4. KING ZARAK - Mostly modest form of late and was 7th last time out in a Conditions race at 
Compiegne over 2800m on 11 October. Better over furth and others are preferred 

5. EVERSTAR - Unreliable but was runner-up last time out in a Conditions race at Amiens over 
1650m on 29 September. Can contest the finish again 

6. XILOFONO - Has struck form of late and was a winner last time out in a handicap at La Teste-
de-Buch over 2400m on 30 August. Tries the PSF but is not out of it 

7. LA CUESTIONADA - Did not show her best when 9th last time out at Madrid over 2300m on 
15 September. Better over further and others are preferred 

8. ROLLERCOASTER - Unreliable and was fourth last time out in a Claimer at Vichy over 1600m 
on 16 July. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

9. ARIGATO - Disappointing of late and was 7th in a claimer last time out at Marseille-Borely over 
2000m on 16 September. More is needed to win 

10. SITOI - Disappointing last run when 9th in a claimer at Saint-Cloud over 1400m on 14 
October. Capable of better and has a place chance 

11. LALA LIGHT - Unreliable and was fourth last time out in a claimer at Chantilly over 1900m on 
1 October. Might play a minor role 

12. SOUL AND ROMANCE - Did not show her best when unplaced last time out in a handicap at 
Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 10 October. Won a claimer before that and is not out of it 

13. WORLD VISION - Only modest of late and was 5th last time out at Dortmund over 1800m on 
5 October. Capable of better and could make the frame 

Summary: PURPLE MOOD (3) struggled last time out at Chantilly. He has been very effective 
over this particular course and distance. He can bounce back to score. EVERSTAR (5) is 
unreliable but did run well last time out and could be a danger trying a claimer. WELCOME 
CHARLY (2) is in good form and could be competitive again. WORLD VISION (13) has German 
form and is expected to improve. 

SELECTIONS 

PURPLE MOOD (3) - EVERSTAR (5) - WELCOME CHARLY (2) - WORLD VISION (13) 
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C5 - PRIX DE CASTILLON - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL WEATHER - Handicap - 

Flat - EUR € 27,000  

 
1. TELCHERBOLINE - Yet to win a race but has been ultra-consistent and was runner-up last 
time out in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 27 September. Can go one better this time 

2. ANACONDA - Yet to win a race but was fourth last time out in a Conditions race at Nimes over 
1900m on 6 October. Can contest the finish 

3. IFFROCTA FAL - Has improved with each run and was third last time out in a Conditions race 
at Craon over 1650m on 22 September. First time in a handicap and has a place chance 

4. INTER POL - Showed some improvement when fourth last time out in a handicap at Saint-
Cloud over 1600m on 10 October. Not out of it 

5. EL PEQUENIO - Good last run when third in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 10 
October. Should do even betetr this time around 

6. SALSA ROSE - Has been good in claimers of late and was victorious last time out at Royan La 
Palmyre over 1600m on 15 September. Not out of it trying the PSF 

7. GUACARI - Showed improvement when fourth last time out in a Conditions race at Marseille-
Borely over 1700m on 28 September. Capable of improvement and deserves respect 

8. GWO KA - Showed vast improvement when 5th last time out in a Conditiosn race at Chantilly 
over 1600m on 1 October. Could earn some money 

9. LOUIS DEUX - Disappointing last run when 8th in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over 1600m on 
27 September. Others are preferred 

10. REZZONICO - Has run well in a couple of claimers of late and was third last time out at 
Argentan over 1900m on 9 October. Could earn some minor money 

Summary: TELCHERBOLINE (1) has been very consistent so far. She could have that 
consistency rewarded by going one better this time. There was not much between EL 
PEQUENIO (5) and INTER POL (4) last time out and both can get involved with the finish yet 
again. IFFROCTA FAL (3) has improved with each run and could contest the finish again on 
handicap debut. 

SELECTIONS 

TELCHERBOLINE (1) - EL PEQUENIO (5) - INTER POL (4) - IFFROCTA FAL (3) 
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C6 - PRIX D'AUDRIEU - 1900m (a1m1/4) - ALL WEATHER - Class 4 

Claiming Handicap - Flat - EUR € 16,000  

 
1. INATTENDU - Unreliable and was 6th last time out in a handicap at Le Croisé-Laroche over 
1800m on 18 October. Can contest the finish when in the mood 

2. ITAEWON - Not disgraced when 5th last time out in a claimer at ParisLongchamp over 1400m 
on 29 August. Capable of making the frame 

3. LAUGHINGOF FEAR - Unreliable and was runner-up last time out in a Conditions race at 
Jarnac over 2500m on 8 September. Might play a minor role at best 

4. PRINCE OF DAWN - Holding his form and was fourth last time out in a Conditions race at La 
Roche-Posay over 2200m on 8 September. Might earn some minor money 

5. CHIEF MAMBO - Disappointing last run when 9th in a claimer at Chantilly over 1600m on 17 
October. In  good form before that and is not out of it 

6. CHARM KING - Has struggled of late and was 8th last time out in a handicap at Bordeaux-Le 
Bouscat over 1900m on 13 October. Could surprise returning to the PSF 

7. ON Y VA - Did not show his best when 12th last time out in a handicap at Deauville over 
1900m on 17 August. Has a winning chance but is unreliable 

8. NORTH HUNTER - Did not show his best when 7th last time out in this division at Saint-Cloud 
over 2000m on 14 October. Did better before that but others are preferred 

9. PRESOMPTION - Yet to win a race but was runner-up last time out in a claimer at Chantilly 
over 1600m on 17 October. Can go one better this time 

10. ZAYA DE LA PLATA - On a very long losing run and was 5th last time out in a Conditions 
race at Vannes over 1500m on 21 September. Can contest the finish 

11. LIGHTED GLORY - Finished 5th last time out at Hyeres in a Conditions race over 1850m on 
29 September. Has a good record in this division and should fight out the finish 

12. SUNLIKE - Yet to win a race and was tenth last time out in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over 
2000m on 27 September. Others are much preferred 

Summary: LIGHTED GLORY (11) has a good record in claimer and can bounce back to win. 
ZAYA DE LA PLATA (10) was not disgraced at Vannes last time out and could break a long 
losing run if at best. ON Y VA (7) struggled at this course last time out but is clearly better than 
that run would suggest and would not be a surprise winner. INATTENDU (1) is unreliable but is 
also not out of it. 

SELECTIONS 

LIGHTED GLORY (11) - ZAYA DE LA PLATA (10) - ON Y VA (7) - INATTENDU (1) 
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C7 - PRIX DE L'ECLUSE FRANCOIS I ER - 1300m (a6f1/2) - ALL WEATHER 

- Divided Handicap - Flat - EUR € 19,000  

 
1. BAILEYS BACHELOR - Disappointing last run when 8th in a handicap at Fontainebleau over 
1200m on 8 October. Capable of better and is not out of it 

2. QUITE RIGHT TOO - Yet to win a race but did show vast improvement when runner-up last 
time out in a handicap at Le Croisé-Laroche over 1100m on 19 September. Can go one better 
this time 

3. ENNEDI - Unreliable and was well beaten last time out in a handicap at Fontainebleau over 
1200m on 8 October. Won her penultimate start but is hard to trust 

4. EXQUISEMENT - Improving and was third last time out in a handicap at Amiens over 1650m 
on 29 September. Has a winning chance in this line-up 

5. GRECIAN POEM - Well beaten in all three starts and was 12th last time out in a Conditions 
race at Comiegne over 1600m on 17 September. Capable of improvement trying a handicap 

6. NOBLE COTAI - Disappointing recent runs and was tenth last time out in a handicap at 
Fontainebleau over 1200m on 8 October. Capable of better and has a place chance 

7. AMOUREUSE - Did not show her best when 11th last time out in a handicap at Vichy over 
1400m on 23 September. In good form before that and has a winning chance 

8. BAYLINER - Yet to win a race but was 5th last time out in a Conditions race at Toulouse over 
1200m on 25 September. Could play a minor role 

9. CHUNKA WAKAN - On a long losing run and was 5th last time out in a handicap at Le Croisé-
Laroche over 1100m on 7 October. Could play a minor role 

10. SI CAPO SI - Unreliable and was 8th last time out in a handicap at Chantilly over 1900m on 
15 October. Drops in distancre and could surprise 

11. PLATINE - Has struggled in most of her starts so far and was well beaten last time out in a 
handicap at Fontainebleau over 1200m on 8 October. Others are much preferred 

12. HAPPY AGAIN - Unreliable but did not run badly when third last time out in a claimer at 
Marseille-Vivaux over 1500m on 9 October. Could earn some money 

13. TIGER KING - Not disgraced when third last time out in a handicap at Craon over 1300m on 
22 September. Capable of an upset 

14. GARDEN CHOP - Yet to win a rasce and was 9th last time out in a Conditions race at Amiens 
over 2200m on 29 September. Others are preferred 

15. MOONWALKER - Yet to win a race and was well beaten last time out in a claimer at Le 
Croisé-Laroche over 1800m on 7 October. Others are much preferred 

Summary: A very competitive looking handicap. EXQUISEMENT (4) is improving so gets the 
narrow vote to score. AMOUREUSE (7) was in good form before struggling at Vichy last time 
around. BAILEYS BACHELOR (1) is capable of betetr than the last run would suggest and could 
improve on this surface. QUITE RIGHT TOO (2) showed good improvement last time and could 
go one better. 
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SELECTIONS 

EXQUISEMENT (4) - AMOUREUSE (7) - BAILEYS BACHELOR (1) - QUITE RIGHT TOO (2) 
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C8 - PRIX DU CANAL DU HAVRE - 1300m (a6f1/2) - ALL WEATHER - 

Divided Handicap - Flat - EUR € 21,000  

 
1. FOU FURIEUX - Very unreliable and was well beaten last time out in a handicap at 
Fontainebleau over 1200m on  8 October. Capable of popping up in a place when in the mood 

2. IRIDIA - Has struggled of late and was well beaten last time out in a handicap at Fontainebleau 
over 1200m on 8 October. Others are preferred 

3. MISS WOO WOO - Did not show her best when 11th last time out in a Claimer at Saint-Cloud 
over 1400m on 14 October. Likes this track and trip and can bounce back to score 

4. TEMPO - Very unreliable and was well beaten last time out in a handicap at Fontainebleau 
over 1200m on 8 October. Better judged on his penultimate start and is not out of it 

5. STORMYGO - Did not show his best when tenth last time out in a handicap at Fontainebleau 
over 1200m on 8 October. In good form before that and has a winning chance 

6. HOUBI - Unreliable but was runner-up last time out in a handicap at Fontainebleau over 
1200m on 8 October. Has a winning chance 

7. FAVORY CHOP - Not disgraced when 5th last time out in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over 
1600m on 6 September. Might play a minor role 

8. HAUTE GAMME - May have needed the last run when 6th in a handicap at Compiegne over 
1400m on 17 September. Could earn some minor money 

9. BABETTE - Showed some improvement when 5th last time out in a Conditions race at 
Compiegne over 1600m on 25 September. Could surprise back on the PSF 

10. RUN FOR HOME - Unreliable but was fourth last time out in a handicap at Fontainebleau 
over 1200m on 8 October. Might play a minor role 

11. CHIRICCO - In good form and was runner-up last time out in a handicap at Craon over 
1300m on 22 September. Could earn soem minor money 

12. LOVECAYAN - Disappointing recent form and was tenth last time out in a claimer at Saint-
Cloud over 1600m on 20 September. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

13. LAS VEGAS DREAM - Unreliable but was not disgraced when fourth last time out in a 
handicap at La Teste-de-Buch over 1600m on 12 September. Drops in distance and others are 
preferred 

14. LIBERTE - Yet to win a race and was 7th last time out in a handicap at Craon over 1300m on 
22 September. Capable of playing a minor role 

15. BAKHILOVA - In very good shape and was a winner last time out in a handicap at 
Fontainebleau over 1200m on 8 October. Carries a 2kg penalty but can follow up 

16. INTUITION - Disappointing last run when well beaten in a handicap at Saint-Cloud over 
1600m on 6 September. Has a place chance 
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Summary: MISS WOO WOO (3) has done her best over this particular course and distance. She 
can take out this lucky last race. STORMYGO (5) was in good form before flopping at  
Fontainebleau earlier this month and deserves respect. BAKHILOVA (15) is in good form and can 
overcome a 2.50kg penalty and score again. HOUBI (6) got close to winning last time out but is 
not reliable. 

SELECTIONS 

MISS WOO WOO (3) - STORMYGO (5) - BAKHILOVA (15) - HOUBI (6) 

 


