
          THURSDAY, 28/11/24 

 

R4 MAUQUENCHY [L-H] 

 

C1 - PRIX HORSE WINNER - 2850m (a2m) - Class E Race - Harness - EUR 

€ 21,000  

 
1. KISS MELODY - Very hard to trust but was runner-up last time out in Class F over this track 
and trip on 17 November. Can go one better if in the same mood 

2. KENZA DE LA BESVRE - Has struggled of late and ws 8th last time out in Class F over this 
track and trip on 22 November. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

3. KHATUN BORTE - Disqualified at North-on-Erdre on 1 September. Had some fair form before 
that but others make more appeal 

4. KOLENCIA DE WARNOC - Not disgraced when 5th last time out in Class F at La Capelle over 
2750m on 3 November. Can contest the finish 

5. KALEZIA POTERIE - Only modest of late and was 5th last time out in Class F at Reims over 
2550m on 24 November. Might play a minor role 

6. KINDLE DE NGANDA - Unreliable and was tenth last time out in Class F at Cherbourg over 
2625m on 24 November. Capable of a surprise when wise 

7. KANAILLE DU MONT - Has lost her way of late and was disqualified last time out at 
Cherbourg 24 November. Needs major improvement to win 

8. KIBORA BUISSONAY - Not easy to trust but is in good shape and was third last time out in 
Class F at La Capelle over 2750m on 3 November. Not out of it 

9. KLARISSA - Has struck form with two solid wins in a row, the latest in Class A at Laon over 
2225m on 13 October. Can complete the hat-trick 

10. KISS ME DU THENNEY - Unreliable and was fourth last time out in Class F at Lisieux over 
2725m on 1 November. Has a winning chance 

11. KROKEUSE - Unreliable and was 8th last time out in Class D at Vincennes over 2700m on 
30 October. Has a place chance on best form 

12. KEEN ACTION - On a very long losing run and was 8th last time out in Class E at Cabourg 
over 2750m on 13 August. Needs major improvement to win 

13. KIARHA DE NAPPES - Returned to form with a barefoot win last time out in Class E at Le 
Croisé-Laroche over 2700m on 9 November. Not unshod this time and others are preferred 

14. KALEDA DE LA COUR - Did not show her best when 8th last time out in Class A at Laval 
over 2850m on 8 November. In good form before that and has a winning chance 

15. KARA DE PIERREPONT - Disqualified in four of her last five races including last time out at 
Vincennes on 17 November. Probably best watched for now 
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Summary: KLARISSA (9) has been very good of late and can complete the hat-trick. KARA DE 
PIERREPONT (15) did not show her best at Laval last time out but is capable of being a serious 
threat. KISS ME DU THENNEY (10) is not easy to trust but did run well last time out and is 
capable of getting into the mix of things once again. KIBORA BUISSONAY (8) has been in good 
form of late and also has a winning chance. 

SELECTIONS 

KLARISSA (9) - KALEDA DE LA COUR (14) - KISS ME DU THENNEY (10) - KIBORA 

BUISSONAY (8) 
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C2 - PRIX GENY COURSES - 2850m (a2m) - Class F Race - Harness - EUR 

€ 21,000  

 
1. JAGGER D'AUT - Finished 12th in class F at this track over 2150m on 10 November. 
Unreliable and has disqualification issues. Others are preferred 

2. JAZZ - Disqualified in class F at this course over 2150m on 10 November. Has major 
disqualification issues and is best watched for now 

3. JULIUS BERRY - Unreliable and was fourth in class F at this course over 2150m on 10 
November. Has a place chance 

4. JUPILLE DE GODREL - Consistent and was third in class F at Graignes over 2725m on 2 
September. Victorious in July when barefoot but not unshod this time. Might play a minor role 

5. JESSY LUCKY - Finished 7th in class F at Les Sables-d'Olonne over 2525m on 15 
September. On a long losing streak and needs to find a few lengths to win 

6. JOLIE CADENCE - Finished 10th in class F at Reims over 2500m on 24 November. On a long 
losing streak and more is needed to win 

7. JUBILATION - Not disgraced when 5th in class F at this track over 2850m on 17 November. 
Could play a minor role 

8. JAVA DU GERS - Holding form and was fourth in class E at Vincennes over 2850m on 29 
October when barefoot. Big chance 

9. JAG DU LIOT - Has struggled of late and was 10th in class F at Maure-de-Bretagne over 
2850m on 3 November. Others are much preferred 

10. JERICHO D'ORGERES - Unreliable and was runner-up in class F at Le Croisé-Laroche over 
2700m on 1 November. Has shown improvement and is barefoot. Can go one better 

11. JANGO ELEVEN - Finished 6th in class F at this course over 2150m on 10 November. Won 
on three occasions this year and is capable of an upset 

12. JUPITER FRANCE - In good form and was runner-up in class F at Marseille-Borély over 
2400m on 15 November. Should contest the finish 

13. JIRAFENN LORIETTES - Disappointing of late and was 11th in Class F at Maure-de-
Bretagne over 2850m on 3 November. Unreliable and others make more appeal 

14. JACKPOT DE L'ENVOL - Not disgraced when 5th in class F at this track over 2150m on 10 
November. Remains barefoot and can make the frame 

Summary: JAVA DU GERS (8) is very consistent and ran another decent race at Vincennes last 
month. That consistency could be rewarded with a winning turn this time around. JUPITER 
FRANCE (12) is in good form and should challenge for top honours. JERICHO D'ORGERES (10) 
showed some improvement last time out and is barefoot. JACKPOT DE L'ENVOL (14) is another 
to consider. 

SELECTIONS 

JAVA DU GERS (8) - JUPITER FRANCE (12) - JERICHO D'ORGERES (10) - JACKPOT DE 

L'ENVOL (14) 
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C3 - PRIX L'ECLAIREUR / LA DEPECHE - 2850m (a2m) - Class E Race - 

Harness - EUR € 21,000  

 
1. KARNAC D'ALCI - Finished 8th in class F at this course over 2850m on 17 November. 
Unreliable and others are preferred this time 

2. KING DE FOURCHES - Disqualified in class F at Reims over 2550m on 12 October when 
barefoot. Has room to improve but others are preferred 

3. KOUGAR DES RACQUES - Not disgraced when 5th in class F at this track over 2850m on 17 
November. Returns barefoot and is capable of earning some money 

4. KARLO - Showed improvement when runner-up in class F at this course over 2850m on 17 
November. Can go one better 

5. KADJAR - Disappointing last run when 10th in class F at Saumer over 3250m on 20 October. 
Victorious in September but this is a tougher ask 

6. KALIBRE - In good form and was fourth in class F at Châtelaillon-La Rochelle over 2500m on 
9 November. Should contest the finish 

7. KICK UP GEDE - Unreliable and was 9th in class F at Maure-de-Bretagne over 2850m on 17 
November. Others make more appeal 

8. KIDAM DU METZ - Disqualified in class F at La Capelle over 2750m on 3 November. 
Unreliable and needs major improvement to win 

9. KIWI DE CHINE - Victorious in Class F at Vire over 2800m on 10 November. Has major 
disqualification issues but is capable of following up if in the same mood 

10. KRONOS DES LANDES - Unreliable but was third in class F at Vire over 2800m on 20 
November. Can get involved with the finish 

11. KING AULNAIES - Only modest of late and was 6th in class F at Graignes over 2700m on 11 
November. Needs to do a bit more to win 

12. KANDAR JIEL - Not disgraced when 5th in class B at Vincennes over 2700m on 3 
December. Returns for the first time since 2022 and is likely to need this run 

13. KING LOOK - Victorious in Class E at Les Sables-d'Olonne over 2650m on 8 July. 
Inconsistent and could need this run 

14. KIMI DU DOME - Victorious in Class F at Graignes over 2725m on 2 November. Won twice 
this year and can double up in this line-up 

15. KAID FORTUNA - Has some fair form and was fourth in class E at Vincennes over 2200m on 
12 November. On a long losing streak but could play a minor role 

16. KANSAS QUESNOT - Victorious in Class E at La Capelle over 2700m on 11 November. 
Remains barefoot and should fight out the finish 

Summary: KIMI DU DOME (14) has already won a couple of times this year including last time 
out. He does have to give them start but he can follow up. KANSAS QUESNOT (16) is in good 
shape and can be a real threat this track and distance. KALIBRE (6) continues to be competitive 
and is not out of it. KARLO (4) showed improvement last time out and would not be a surprise 
winner. 
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SELECTIONS 

KIMI DU DOME (14) - KANSAS QUESNOT (16) - KALIBRE (6) - KARLO (4) 
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C4 - PRIX REXEL FRANCE - 2850m (a2m) - Class E Race - Harness - EUR 

€ 30,000  

 
1. GRANDE MALICE - Disqualified in class F at Le Croisé-Laroche over 2700m on 14 October. 
Barefoot for this one but is on a long losing streak 

2. GISARO - Unreliable but was third in class E at Angers over 3125m on 11 November. Is 
barefoot for this one and is not out of it 

3. HORIZON D'AMARO - Disqualified in class G at Les Sables-d'Olonne over 2650m on 12 
August. Not unshod this time and has yet to win this year. Best watched for now 

4. HOLLY GREEN - Victorious in Class G at this course over 2850m on 22 November. Remains 
barefoot and can contest the finish 

5. HENZO DE CARSI - Has some fair form and was fourth in class E at Châteaubriant over 
3000m on 11 November when barefoot. May need to do a bit more to win this race 

6. HEUREUX DE FLEUR - Finished 8th in class E at Graignes over 2725m on 12 November. 
Inconsistent and needs to find a few lengths to win 

7. GERGOVIE DE GODREL - Unreliable and was third in class E at Graignes over 2725m on 12 
November. Remains barefoot and can earn some minor money 

8. HEAVEN STAR - In very good form and was victorious in Class E at Saint-Brieuc over 2500m 
on 3 November. Likely to be competitive again 

9. GENEVRIER - Disqualified in class E at Vincennes over 2850m on 8 November. Has major 
disqualification issues and others make more appeal 

10. HIVER D'AUTHISE - Victorious in Class E at Graignes over 2725m on 12 November. Has 
struck form well and can complete the hat-trick 

11. FERGIE HIGHLAND - Not disgraced when 5th in class E at Angers over 3125m on 11 
November. Unreliable  and others are preferred this time 

12. HERMES D'ECROVILLE - Disappointing of late and was 6th in class D at Vincennes over 
2100m on 17 November. Won well in August and is capable of contesting the finish 

13. EVAN PAULO - Showed some improvement when third in class C at Graignes over 2725m 
on 13 October when barefoot. On a long losing streak but might play a minor role 

14. GIBALDI DE HOUELLE - Needed the last run when 11th in Class E at Maure-de-Bretagne 
over 2850m on 20 October. Has scored on 17 occasions in 60 attempts and can contest the finish 

Summary: HIVER D'AUTHISE (10) has won three of his last four starts and looked as good as 
ever when scoring at Graignes earlier this month. He may well score again. GIBALDI DE 
HOUELLE (14) knowshow to win and clearly needed the last run. He can be a danger if smart 
this time. HERMES D'ECROVILLE (12) seems betetr than the recent runs would suggest. 
HEAVEN STAR (8) remai9ns in good form and can be competitive again. 

SELECTIONS 

HIVER D'AUTHISE (10) - GIBALDI DE HOUELLE (14) - HERMES D'ECROVILLE (12) - 

HEAVEN STAR (8) 
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C5 - PRIX FRANCE BLEU NORMANDIE - 2850m (a2m) - Class F Race - 

Mounted - EUR € 21,000  

 
1. JOLLY HARBOUR - Has disqualification issues and was disqualified last time out at Angers 
on 13 June. Returns from a break and should need this run 

2. JAR BEN - Disqualified in his last four starts, with the latest being at Meslay-du-Maine on 17 
November. Probably best watched for now 

3. JOUR DE VEINE - On a long losing run and was 8th last time out in a Class E harness race at 
Châlons-en-Champagne over 2625m on 22 September. Others are much preferred 

4. JELLINO SPRINT - Only modest of late and was 7th last time out in a Class F Mounted race at 
Nantes over 3000m on 6 November. Needs to do more to win this race 

5. JEHAN - Has major disqualification issues and was disqualified last time out at Vincennes on 
22 October. Capable of earning some minor money when wise 

6. JAFFNA SHAN - Unreliable and was 8th last time out in a Class G harness race at Vire over 
2800m on 20 November. Did better under the saddle before that and has a winning chance 

7. JACKPOT BREIZH - On a very long losing run since only win but was 5th last time out in a 
Class F Mounted race over this course and distance on 10 November. Might play a minor role 

8. JANUS DE VRIE - Much improved of late with two recent Mounted race wins at Graignes, with 
the latest being in Class E over 2700m on 2 November. Can complete the hat-trick 

9. JOLICOEUR D'ATHOS - Disqualified last time out at Feurs on 29 October. Has been 
unreliable this year but is not out of it 

10. JOVANY - In very good form and was third last time out in a Class F Mounted race over this 
course and distance on 10 November. Should contest the finish 

11. JOKER DES BORDES - Has disqualification issues and was 8th last time out in a Class F 
harness race at Maure-de-Bretagne over this distance on 3 November. Did better under the 
saddle before that and has a winning chance 

12. JUDICY DE VIVE - Has lost the way of late and was disqualified last time out at Graignes on 
23 November. Others make more appeal 

13. JOIE DE VIVRE - Unreliable but was runner-up last time out in a Class F Mounted race at 
Vincennes over 2175m on 17 November. Can contest the finish 

14. JACKPOT DU WALLON - Did not show his best when 8th last time out in a Class F Mounted 
race at Nantes over 3000m on 6 November. Won two in a row before that and has a place 
chance 

15. JULIANO DELTO - Unreliable and was 9th last time out in a Class G harness at Saint-Malo 
over 2950m on 1 November. A barefoot Mounted race winner of his penultimate start and is 
unshod again 
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Summary: JANUS DE VRIE (8) clearly likes these Mounted races and is now hat-trick seeking 
after two solid wins at Graignes. This track should not be a problem and he can complete the 
treble. JULIANO DELTO (15) struggled in a harness race last time out but is better judged on the 
pebutlmate start victory. He was barefoot for that win and is unshod this time. JOKER DES 
BORDES (11) likes this discipline and is not out of it. JOVANY (10) is in good shape and also has 
a winning chance. 

SELECTIONS 

JANUS DE VRIE (8) - JULIANO DELTO (15) - JOKER DES BORDES (11) - JOVANY (10) 
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C6 - PRIX DE LA GUINGUETTE - 2850m (a2m) - Class E Race - Harness - 

EUR € 21,000  

 
1. LUTIN DE BOISNEY - Has some fair form and was third last time out in E at Caen over 2200m 
on 29 May. Likely to need this run returning from a break 

2. LADY MIDNIGHT - Has disqualification issues and was disqualified last time out at Amiens on 
15 November. Could play a minor role if smart 

3. LEON STONE - Disqualified last time out at Vincennes on 18 November. Has yet to win a race 
and others make more appeal 

4. LAURA SISSI - Very hard to trust but was victorious last time out in Class E at Strasbourg over 
2800m on 25 October. Can follow up if in the same mood 

5. L'AMIRAL DU SAPTEL - Returned to form when third last time out in Class F at Amiens over 
2400m on 15 November. Can contest the finish again 

6. LAST DES BROUSSES - Disqualified on his debut but he has won his next two starts, with the 
latest being in Class F at Rambouillet over 2000m on 6 October. Not out of it 

7. LA CALLAS - Undefeated after two starts, with the latest in Class F over this course and 
distance on 17 November. Big chance 

8. LOOPING MIL - Has struggled of late and was 7th last time out in Class E at Graignes over 
2725m on 12 November. Others are much preferred 

9. LIBERTY FRECA - Consistent and was victorious last time out in Class E at Laval over this 
distance on 8 November. Has a place chance 

10. L'ETOILE DE ROCHE - Yet to win a race but was not disgraced when 5th last time out in 
Class D at Vincennes over 2700m on 24 September. Has a place chance 

11. LAPS GEDE - Yet to win a race and was 8th last time out in Class C at Vincennes over 
2700m on 30 October. Others are preferred 

12. LE METEQUE - Yet to win a race but has been runner-up in his last two starts, with the latest 
being in Class E at Vincennes over 2700m on 12 November. Be right there at the finish once 
again 

13. LITTLEKING FOXGLEN - Unreliable and was 6th last time out in Class C at Caen over 
2450m on 12 October. Capable of an upset 

14. LOVI CADENCE - Only modest of late and was 7th last time out in Class D at Vincennes over 
2175m o 9 November. Needs to find a few lengths to win 

15. LE ROCKER DE PLAY - Did not show his best when 6th last time out in Class C at 
Vincennes over 2700m on 30 October. Could be the surprise package of the race 

16. LA MITIDJA - Disqualified in her last two starts with the latest being at Vincennes on 8 
November. Capable of earning some minor money when smart 



          THURSDAY, 28/11/24 

 

Summary: LA CALLAS (7) has looked good in both her wins and can remain undefeated and a 
hat-trick winner. L'AMIRAL DU SAPTEL (5) fluffed his lines with a disqualification in his 
penultimate start but returned to form with decent performance last time out and can do even 
better this time. LE METEQUE (12) is knocking hard at the door for a first win and should be 
involved with the finish. LAST DES BROUSSES (6) has improved with some nice wins but was 
disqualified on debut. 

SELECTIONS 

LA CALLAS (7) - L'AMIRAL DU SAPTEL (5) - LE METEQUE (12) - LAST DES BROUSSES 

(6) 
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C7 - PRIX HIPPOMAT - 2850m (a2m) - Class F Amateur Riders Race - 

Harness - EUR € 23,000  

 
1. HOULENN DU PILET - Finished 6th in class G at Nantes over 3000m on 17 November. On a 
long losing streak and more is needed to win this race 

2. HIRONDELLE D'AVEZE - Showed some improvement when 5th in class G at this track over 
2850m on 17 November. On a long losing streak and is best watched for now 

3. HISTOIRE HIBE - Has really struggled of late and was 11th in Class E at Laval over 2850m on 
18 November. Has major disqualification issues and others are preferred 

4. HARLEM LOCA - Disqualified in class F at Le Mont-Saint-Michel over 2675m on 17 
November. Capable of a surprise when wise 

5. HELOUIS DE ZAERI - Victorious in Class G at this course over 2850m on 17 November. 
Barefoot this time and can double up 

6. HADRIANA DU MONT - Unreliable and was 10th in class F at Le Mont-Saint-Michel over 
2675m on 17 November. Others make more appeal 

7. HELLO CAUVELLIERE - Very hard to trust and was 14th in class F at Le Mont-Saint-Michel 
over 2675m on 17 November. Has major disqualification issues and is best watched for now 

8. HARIBELLE DANOVER - Disappointing of late and was 7th in class E at Vire over 2800m on 
20 November. Returns barefoot but is unreliable 

9. HUNIQUE - Not disgraced when 5th in class E at Machecoul over 2700m on 20 October. May 
need to find a few lengths to win 

10. HERINE D'OCCAGNES - Finished 10th in class F at this course over 2850m on 10 
November. Unreliable and needs to find a few lengths to win 

11. HECTOR DU MINON - Disqualified in class E at this course over 2850m on 13 November. 
Yet to score this year and others are preferred 

12. HARPIE DE JED - Has some fair form and was fourth in class E at this track over 2850m on 
13 November. Remains barefoot and has a winning chance 

13. HIDE AND SEEK - Not disgraced when 5th in class D at Vincennes over 2850m on 8 
November. Can contest the finish 

14. HELIA DE LAXA - Did not show her best when 7th in class G at Laval over 2850m on 8 
November. Won in August and can bounce back to score 

15. HASCHELEY BERRY - Disqualified in class D at Reims over 2550m on 14 November when 
barefoot. On a long losing streak and others are preferred 

16. HENGY DU POMMEREUX - Disqualified in class D at Reims over 2550m on 14 November. 
Capable of making the frame when smart 

Summary: HELIA DE LAXA (14) let her supporters down last time out but is clearly better than 
that run would suggest and could recoup losses. HIDE AND SEEK (13) was not disgraced at 
Vincennes last time out and should be a lively danger to these runners. HARPIE DE JED (12) is 
susually competitive and can make the frame. HELOUIS DE ZAERI (5) won in this division last 
time out and is barefoot so can double up. 
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SELECTIONS 

HELIA DE LAXA (14) - HIDE AND SEEK (13) - HARPIE DE JED (12) - HELOUIS DE ZAERI 

(5) 
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C8 - PX OFFICE DU TOURISME DE FORGES LES EAUX - 2850m (a2m) - 

Class G Amateur Drivers Race - Harness - EUR € 6,000  

 
1. HORYVIL DES MOYEUX - Unreliable and was fourth in this division at Cherbourg over 2625m 
on 24 November. Can be competitive once again 

2. GOVANON - Has major diqualification issues and was disqualified last time out at Cherbourg 
on 24 November. Best watched for now 

3. HAUGAIN - Did not show his best when barefoot and 6th last time out in this division over this 
course and distance on 22 November. Unreliable but can contest the finish 

4. GRAZIELLA MIP - Unreliable and was 8th last time out in this division at Cherbourg over 
2625m on 24 November. Did better at this track in her penultimate start and has a winning 
chance 

5. HARLEY DE JANEIRO - Disappointing form of late and was disqualified last time out at this 
course on 24 November. Capable of earning some money when in the mood 

6. HEROS DE BANVILLE - Has struggled of late and was 13th last time out at Vincennes over 
2700m on 23 November. Others are preferred 

7. FESTIF DU RADON - Disappointing recent form and was 8th last time out in this division over 
this track and trip on 24 November. Others make more appeal 

8. GENIALE STAR - Has lost her way of late and was disqualified last time out at Enghien on 17 
October. Capable of better but is best watched for now 

9. HALAFOLY ROBSEN - Returned to form when scoring in this division at Cherbourg over 
2625m on 24 November. Can double up if in the same mood 

10. HAVE A LOVE - Has really struggled of late and was 12th last time out in a claimer at 
Châteaubriant over 3025m on 11 November. Others are much preferred 

11. HUNMEC SOMOLLI - Disappointing form of late and was 9th last time out in this division at 
Vire over 2800m on 10 November. Has run well at this course and could surprise 

12. FIER D'ARS - On a very long losing run and was 13th last time out in Class E at Vincennes 
over 2100m on 4 October. Needs major improvement to win 

Summary: HALAFOLY ROBSEN (9) clearly took her win well from the other day and is back and 
ready to score again. It is a competitive lucky last race. GRAZIELLA MIP (4) was only modest the 
day but has done well at this track and can be right there at the finish this time. HAUGAIN (3) is 
better than the last run would suggest and has a winning chance. HORYVIL DES MOYEUX (1) is 
yet another that ran well the other day and deserves some respect. 

SELECTIONS 

HALAFOLY ROBSEN (9) - GRAZIELLA MIP (4) - HAUGAIN (3) - HORYVIL DES MOYEUX 

(1) 

 


